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The phrase “the few, the
proud, the Marines” has a
special meaning for a group
of Korean War veterans who
held their annual reunion in
Grand Chenier last week.
“Monk's Raiders,” the 1st
Marine Division Ammo
Company led by Charles
“Monk” Arndt, are getting
older and fewer as the years
go by, but the pride is still
there.

“We aren't former
Marines,” said John Richard,
host of this year's reunion,
“we are just Marines. Like
they say, once a Marine,
always a Marine.”

The men are also proud of
their leader. Monk Arndt is
the last survivor of the first
U. S. offensive on
Guadalcanal in World War
II. Of the 24 men who set out
on a largely humanitarian
mission in August, 1942,
only three survived, two of
whom have since passed
away. Monk is still going
strong at 89, however.

“He's in better shape than
all of us,” says Richard. “He
drove his motor home with a
car behind it from Columbus,
Miss.”

Monk, nick-named for his
agility in running up a
coconut tree in Puerto Rico
in 1939, was an intelligence

scout in WWII and saw much
more action on Guadalcanal.

According to an article
written by Tom McLeod, his-
torian for the 1st Marine
Division, he went on 22 solo
intelligence gathering mis-
sions behind enemy lines.
One mission lasted two
weeks and covered 25 miles,
during which Monk lived off
the land, only taking with
him one pound of raisins.

Being a small man, only
5'4” and 125 pounds, once
saved his life, wrote McLeod,
as he was able to crawl
under a fallen tree to hide
from an “entire Japanese
company that ran over and
past him.”

Size meant nothing to the
men of the ammo company to
which he was attached dur-
ing the Korean Conflict. At
31 he was considered an “old
man” by the 15-19 year olds
assigned to the company
from 1950-53.

John Richard was one of
those young men. Richard
says, “If he told us to take a
hill, even though we thought
we would all die, we went;
we all worshiped him so
much.” 

They were called the
“Frozen Few,” because they
had to endure temperatures
as low as minus 53 degrees

Fisheries
meeting set
June 12th

The Cameron Office of
Planning & Development, on
behalf of the West Cameron
Port, will host a meeting for
the shrimping industry of
Cameron Parish at 6 p.m.
Thursday, June 12, at the
Hackberry Community
Center. This briefing is being
held to discuss current
industry needs, current
activities in lower Cameron,
and anticipated development
opportunities in Hackberry
and other locations.

Executive Director Ernie
Broussard says “The com-
mercial fishing industry rep-
resents a significant compo-
nent of our economic and cul-
tural community, and our
endeavors are intended to
recognize and shore up these
linkages.”

In attendance will be the
staff from the Office of
Planning & Development,
and the Louisiana Recovery
Authority. Attendance has
also been requested from the
Department of Wildlife and
Fisheries, the LSU AgCenter
and local elected and
appointed officials. Swim Team

registration
announced

Grand Lake Summer
Swim Team registration will
be held Tuesday, June 3, at
the Grand Lake pool from 9
to 10 a.m.

Swimmers must be able
to swim 20 yards without
stopping. For more informa-
tion contact Felisha Nunez,
coach, at 905-2252.

BByy  SSTTEEPPHHAANNIIEE
RRIICCHHAARRDD

Fur and Wildlife Festival
committee is requesting
recipes. Please submit your
recipes for the 2009 Fur and
Wildlife Festival Cookbook.

Recipes can be emailed to
Shirley Murphy at smur-
phy65@suddenlink.net or
mailed to 2899 Sugarloaf Dr.
#114 Lake Charles, LA
70607.

Marine veterans attend reunion in Grand Chenier

al began yelling. 
The subjects were advised

by Deputy O’Quinn to leave
the property, but one, Shane
Thibodeaux of Merryville,
reportedly continued to yell
at other bystanders. He was
arrested for disturbing the
peace by intoxication and
refusing to leave the scene.

At this point several other
disturbances broke out and
Dep. O’Quinn was joined by
Dep. Adam Precht and Dep.
Kyle Young in trying to
break them up.

Dep.Young was struck on
the back of the head as he
was detaining another indi-
vidual. Patrick Thibodeaux,
of Hackberry, was then
arrested for battery on a

police officer, as was Brad
Thibodeaux, Sulphur, who
allegedly struck Dep.
O’Quinn while he was being
arrested for remaining after
forbidden and disturbing the
peace by intoxication.

More deputies arrived
and Kara Thibodeaux, of
Sulphur, was arrested for
remaining after forbidden by
Dep. Carl Conner. Shana
O'Quain, also of Sulphur was
arrested for remaining after
forbidden and disturbing the
peace by intoxication. Dep.
Donnie Ogea assisted at the
scene.

BByy  CCYYNNDDII  SSEELLLLEERRSS

An after-graduation party
at the Hackberry Commun-
ity Center ended in disarray
last Friday, May 23, when
five people were arrested on
charges ranging from disor-
derly conduct to battery on a
police officer.

The trouble started when
Deputy Vernon O’Quinn,
who was on patrol in the
parking lot, saw an unidenti-
fied young man leave the
building, cursing and threat-
ening an older man. While
O’Quinn was trying to calm
the younger man, twenty or
thirty people exited the
building to watch and sever-

Jury considers rollback
on tax collection

Authority is reactivated

Name omitted

Cameron athletes nominated
for SW La. Hall of Fame

Cont. on Page 3.

to meet for the first time
early next month.

Lake Charles Mayor
Randy Roach will be its
chairman.

Cameron Parish members
of the committee are Ernie
Broussard, executive direc-
tor of planning for Cameron
Parish; Tina Horn, Cameron
Parish Administrator; and
Stephanie Rodrigue,
Cameron Parish School
Superintendent.

Dr. Paul Coreil, LSU
AgCenter vice chancellor,
also is a member. He is a for-
mer Cameron Parish resi-
dent.

The Louisiana Recovery
Authority is reactivating a
task force charged with iden-
tifying and addressing issues
related to the continued
recovery from 2005’s
Hurricane Rita.

Paul Rainwater, the
LRA’s executive director,
said he hopes the task force
will help identify and come
up with ways to overcome
any obstacles to recovery.

The state also wants
input from local officials on
recovery issues including
housing, economic develop-
ment and coastal protection.

The task force is expected

than originally voted is by
advertising for a hearing to
"roll back up" to a millage
allowed by the original tax
election.

This can only happen if
property tax assessments
have risen to a point that
gives a greater return. The
Police Jury has not adver-
tised such a hearing, and
therefore will likely take the
roll-back.

The vote will be taken at
the regular meeting set for
Monday, June 2, at 5:30 p.m.
The parishwide road,
garbage, health unit, library,
courthouse and jail mainte-
nance, and general tax, as
well as individual fire dis-
trict taxes will be set at this
time.

Also on Monday, bids are
expected to be accepted for
the first phase of the Jetty
Fishing Pier and East
Cameron Maintenance Barn
repairs.

BByy  CCYYNNDDII  SSEELLLLEERRSS

The Cameron Parish
Police Jury's agenda meet-
ing, originally scheduled for
Tuesday afternoon, was
moved to Wednesday after-
noon to accommodate the
schedule of a member.

At press time, the Jury
planned to discuss setting
the tax levies for 2008, a
temporary fire station for
Cameron Fire District, and
appropriations for the Creole
recreation and fire districts.

Tax Assessor-elect Mona
Kelley has projected a small
increase in taxable property,
so the Jury will be consider-
ing whether to take the auto-
matic roll-back of millages
prescribed by law. If they do
so, millages will be rolled
back in order to collect no
more funds than were col-
lected last year.

The only way a govern-
ment entity can collect more

Two Cameron Parish high
school athletes are among
the 12 finalists nominated to
be in the Southwest
Louisiana Hall of Fame,
according to Shady Patton,
president of the organiza-
tion.

They are Rachel Fountain
of South Cameron High
School and Lakeyn Duhon of
Grand Lake High School.
They and the ten other final-
ists will be honored
Thursday, June 5 at
Treasures of Marilyn’s in
Lake Charles.

There will be a social at
6:30 p.m., dinner will begin
at 7 p.m. and will be followed
by the program at 8 p.m.
Tickets are $10 each.

For more information,
please contact the United
Way office at 433-1088.

Other finalist are: Kwynn
Biggs and Laura Carleton of
St. Louis High School,
Janessa Doucett of Iowa
High School, Joe Duhon of
Washington/Marion High
School, Alton Fisher of

Five persons arrested
in Hackberry brawl

Sulphur High School, Briana
Horton of Fairview High
School, Becky Hall of
Lacassine High School,
Andrea Miller of Starks High
School, Kegan Myers of
Jennings High School and
Jace Peterson of Hamilton
Christian Academy.

The purpose of the High
School Sports Hall of Fame
is to recognize Southwest
Louisiana high school
seniors who have distin-
guished themselves in the
field of athletics either by
virtue of their accomplish-
ments on athletic teams or
by meritorious effort on
behalf of athletics.

Calvin Murphy,
Basketball Hall of Famer
and host of ESPN Radio’s
‘Calvin Murphy Show’, is the
special guest and keynote
speaker for this year’s ban-
quet. Murphy is a retired
American professional bas-
ketball player who played as
a guard for the NBA’s
Houston Rockets from 1970-
1983.

Smythe is Coach of the Year
((AAmmeerriiccaann  PPrreessss))

For leading Grand Lake
on yet another long playoff
run, head softball coach
Lindsay Smythe is again the
Class B All-State Coach of
the Year as voted by the
Louisiana Sports Writers
Association.

Smythe has led the
Hornets to the Fast Pitch 56
state tournament in each of
her four years as head coach.
She had them there again

this season, where they lost
3-1 to Oak Hill in the title
game.

Smythe was also named
Coach of the Year in 2005
when Grand Lake won the
Class B state title in her first
year as head coach.

Smythe had two seniors
earn first-team all-state hon-
ors--pitcher Lakeyn Duhon
and first baseman Tressa
Theriot. Duhon (13-7-2) bat-
ted .434 with five home runs
while Theriot hit .475.

Justin Trahan was acci-
dentally omitted from the
list of All Around Athletes,
he did receive an award at
the South Cameron High
School Athletic Banquet.

Meeting set
for June 5

Hurricane
meeting set

The Grand Lake -
Sweetlake Action Alliance
meeting will be held on
Thursday, June 5. The meet-
ing will begin at 6 p.m. Julie
Burleigh and the
AmeriCorps group will be
the guests.

All members are urged to
attend and the general pub-
lic is always invited. The
meeting will be held at the
Grand Lake Fireman Center.

Recipes are
sought for
cookbook

The Cameron Parish Office
of Homeland Security and
Emergency Preparedness will
hold its annual hurricane
awareness meeting at 6 p.m.
Thursday, May 29, at the
Crreole Multi Purpose Center.

The Cameron Parish
OHSEP Public Alert System
will be introduced and demon-
strated along with other
important information for the
upcoming season.

All volunteers are urged to
attend. If you are unable to
attend please call 775-7048 to
update your contact informa-
tion.

MARINE VETERANS from WWII and the Korean Conflict attended a reunion in Grand Chenier on Wednesday,
May 21. Charles “Monk” Arndt, center, was the leader of the company, which included Robert Aikens, Roberto
Barrera, Roberto Barrera, Jr., Harry Bunyan, Kenneth Burns, Roy Cannon, Carl Edwards, Santo Gilberto, James
Gray, James Healy, James Hunter, Allen Kirkpatrick, Harry Peterson, Claude Seago, Coleman Spitzer, John Tefft,
Joe Warren, Constance Whalen, Fred Roger, Joe Romano, and Grand Chenier resident John Richard.

(Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)

WORK HAS BEGUN on the church hall and rectory at St. Eugene Catholic Church
in Grand Chenier. Funds for the remodeling have been raised by the congregation
through the annual Alligator Festival and other fundraisers.

(Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)

South Cameron High School
A consolidated PreK-12 complex

H. Curtis Vincent - Steven D. Shows, Architects
See official Bid Notice in Legal Notices in this edition of the Cameron Pilot.

Rachel Fountain Lakeyn Duhon
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MMAARRYY  LLEEBBLLEEUU

Mary Louise Granger
LeBleu, 92, of Big Lake, died
at 4:13 p.m. on Wednesday,
May 21, 2008 in a local care
facility.

Born Sept. 14, 1915 in
Sweetlake, Mrs. LeBleu was
a life resident of Big Lake.
She was a member of Grand
Lake Faith Temple and Big
Lake Gospel Tabernacle in
Grand Lake. She taught
Sunday School at Big Lake
and at Sweetlake Methodist
Church.

Mrs. LeBleu was a long
time member of the Cameron
Parish Council on Aging,
serving on the original board
in 1976, and also serving as
the Alligator Queen in 1984
and the Valentine Day
Queen in 1990. She served as
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FOR HOMES BEYOND

THE GAS MAINS

LAKE ARTHUR
BUTANE CO.

— New Location —
2329 E. McNeese St. 

Lake Charles

1-800-256-1287
Or 439-4051

• Tanks
• Space Heaters
• Gas Heaters
• Gas Logs

Established 1945

Funerals
a board member on the
Louisiana Council on Aging
in 1983 and on the board for
the Cameron Community
Action Board from 1994-
1999.

Mrs. LeBleu also partici-
pated in the Cameron Parish
Senior Olympics. She
enjoyed sewing, crocheting,
cooking and working in her
yard.

Mrs. LeBleu is survived
by his daughter, Ethel M.
Precht and husband Charles
of Sweetlake; grandchildren,
Charles Precht, III and wife
Donna and Kelly Precht and
wife Corrie, all of Sweetlake,
Brenda Guillot of Denver,
Colo., Ellis Nunez and wife
Debbie of Sweetlake and
Dwayne Nunez and wife
Tammy of Sweetlake; 16
great-grandchildren and
seven great-great-grandchil-
dren.

She was preceded in
death by her husband,
Walter LeBleu; daughter,
Betty M. LaBove; parents,
Julian and Julie Granger;
brothers, Clarivelle and
Pierre Granger; grandson,
Jody Nunez; and grandson-
in-law, Wayne Guillot.

Her funeral service was
held at 1 p.m. on Saturday,
May 24, at the Johnson
Funeral Home Chapel.
Reverend Andrew Martin
officiated. Burial was in
Granger Cemetery.

Hwy. 90, Sulphur
527-6391

1-877-288-3314

In Loving Memory Of . . .
Donald Lloyd Rolland

1938 - 1998
Donald Lloyd Rolland

known as Chico, was called
up to heaven 10 years ago
to a place where there is no
pain and suffering or honey
do list.

We miss you so much as
we all depended on you for
different things, but we
know you are smiling down

on us as we go through our journey in life.
There’s not a time we get together without telling so

many stories of when you were here with us. We miss
you.

Your loving wife, children,
grandchildren, family and friends

Visitation was at the funeral
home on Friday from 10 a.m.
to 5 p.m. and continue on
Saturday from 8 a.m. until
the start of the service.

Words of comfort to the
family may be expressed at
www.johnsonfuneralhome.net

((PPaaiidd  MMeemmoorriiaall))

numerous military, academic
and civic honors and awards
throughout his career,
including the Bronze Star
and the Special Breast Order
of the Yun Hui from the
Chinese government. He was
active in civic, academic and
military affairs, retiring
from the Army Reserve in
1972 as a full colonel of the
Infantry. 

Dr. Norris began his
career at McNeese State
University in 1956, when he
came to the school as an
assistant professor of
English. Following his pro-
motion to professor of
English in 1960, he served as
the head of the Department
of Languages from 1961 to
1972. He was appointed
dean of the School of
Humanities in 1972 and
served in that role until he
retired in 1980.

He is survived by his wife,
Hilda G. Norris of Lake
Charles; three children,
Cindy O’Brien and Terry
Travieso of Houston and Pat
Smith and husband Kenny
Ray Smith of Lafayette; nine
grandchildren; and three
great-grandsons. He is also
survived by his sister, Marie
Norris Wise and husband
Maj. Gen. Erbon Wise of
Sulphur. 

Dr. Norris was a  member
of Our Lady of Good Counsel
Catholic Church. 

His funeral was Tuesday,
May 27, at Our Lady of Good
Counsel Catholic Church.
The Rev. Alan Trouille will
officiate. Burial was in
Consolata Cemetery under
the direction of Johnson
Funeral Home.

The Evans P. Mhire
Knights of Columbus held
their monthly meeting on
Tuesday, May 13, with ten
members and District
Deputy Jimmy Paul
Saltzman in attendance.
Election of officers was held
with the following results.

Grand Knight - Garry
Primeaux, Deputy Grand
Knight - Carl Broussard,
Treasurer - Zeke
Wainwright,  Reporter - Walt
Richard, Outside Guard -
Tom Hess, Inside Guard -
Alfred Boudreaux, Warden -
Larry Abshire, 1st. Yr.
Trustee - Darrell East, 2nd
Yr. Trustee - Denton Vincent
and 3rd Yr. Trustee -
Anthony Swire.

This year’s recipients of
the Evan P. Mhire Scholastic
Scholarship Award are Emily
Primeaux and Daniel Dupre,
both graduates of South
Cameron High School.

Final plans for the 3rd
Annual Family Fun Day &
Fishing Tournament set for
Saturday, June 7, were dis-
cussed. Barbecue lunches
will be served.

A Stick Horse Rodeo for
the younger children will be
held that morning. Music

will be provided by: “The
Teardrops” 12-4 p.m. and
“Guy Theriot and The Honky
Tonk Band” from 5-9 p.m. 

For more information con-
tact Garry Primeaux at 842-
4746.

Officers named by Knights

DDRR..  JJOOHHNN  MM..
NNOORRRRIISS  JJRR..

Dr. John M. Norris Jr., 89,
former McNeese member
died Friday, May 23, 2008 in
Lake Charles.

Dr. Norris was born in
Natchitoches on Oct. 14,
1919, the first son of John M.
Norris Sr. and Crockette
Kelly Jones Norris. He was
preceded in death by his par-
ents; beloved son, John M.
Norris III; brother, Crockett
Kelly Norris; and son-in-law,
Robert Travieso. 

Dr. Norris graduated
from St. Mary’s Academy in
Natchitoches in 1936. He
received a B. A. degree from
Louisiana State Normal
College in 1939 and taught
in Bastrop until he was
drafted into the Army in
1941. He left military service
in 1947 with a rank of lieu-
tenant colonel in the infantry
after serving in the U. S. and
overseas in the China the-
atre. He received his mas-
ter’s degree from the
University of Kansas in
1948. He pursued doctoral
studies at the University of
Texas from 1948 to 1952,
serving as a graduate assis-
tant and instructor in the
Department of English at
UT in Austin. 

After being recalled to
active duty during the
Korean Conflict, he taught at
Texas Western College (now,
UT-El Paso) from 1954 to
1956. Dr. Norris was award-
ed his Ph.D. in English by
the University of Texas in
1956. 

He graduated from the
Yale University School of
Oriental Studies and com-
pleted advanced study in
Mandarin Chinese at the
Defense Language Institute
at the Presidio in Monterey,
Calif. Dr. Norris received

WINNER OF THE grand door prize at last week's
Senior Citizen Day was Ruby Nunez, shown with
Council on Aging President Darryl Farque.

(Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)
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Do We Know Where To
Locate You In An

EMERGENCY?
Cameron Parish residents are

asked to number their residence
and business with their address in
large lettering either on the home or
business or on the mail box post.

Lettering should be visible
from the road if it is 

located on the 
Residence or Business

HELP US HELP YOU
WHEN YOU

NEED US MOST!!

Reflective mail box post signs are avail-
able through Cameron Council on Aging.
They can be contacted at 337-905-6000 for
more information or Cameron Parish Office
of Emergency Preparedness at 337-775-
7048.
THANK YOU FROM THE. . .

CAMERON PARISH E911 COMMUNICATION
BOARD OF DIRECTORS

“The Fun Starts Here!”
Thurs., Fri. & Sat.

5:00 p.m. Until
Sunday -- 11:00 a.m. Until

....

HARBOR LIGHTS 
RESTAURANT & BAR

620 Big Lake Rd.
Big Lake

598-4897

Come Try Our Sunday. . .
PLATE LUNCH......................Only 

$7.95
Join Us For The:

FISH FESTIVAL
Saturday, June 7
Outside Parking Lot

Fried Fish & French Fries..............
$5.00

FEATURING MUSIC BY

LACASSINE PLAYBOYS

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC
Notice is hereby given pursuant to

Article 7, Section 23(C) of the
Constitution and R.S. 47:1705(B) that a
public hearing of the Cameron Parish
Water District #11 will be held at the
regular meeting place, the meeting
room of the Cameron Parish Water
District #11 at 111 Dennis Ln. Bell City,
Louisiana, on Monday, July 21, 2008 at
6:00 p.m. to consider levying addition-
al or increased millage rates without
further voter approval or adopting the
adjusted millage rate and rolling for-
ward to a millage rate not to exceed the
prior years’ maximum.

RUN: May 29 & June 2 (M-53)

— Serving All Of Cameron Parish —

Hixson Funeral Homes

Blessed are they 
that mourn, for they 
shall be comforted.

As a trusted member of the 
community, we’ve helped many of
your friends and neighbors through
the most difficult moments of their
lives. In time of need, we’re here for
you.

Hixson Lake Charles
3001 Ryan St. • Lake Charles, LA 70601

337-439-2446

Hixson Sulphur
2051 E. Napoleon St. •Sulphur, LA 70663

337-625-9171

CAMERON COMMUNICATIONS Public Relations
Coordinator Trina Johnson presented a framed print of
the Calcasieu Lighthouse to Cameron Council on
Aging. The print was a door prize item for the agency’s
Annual Senior Day held last Saturday at the Grand
Lake Community Center. Shown with Johnson are
Mary Johnson and Lana Miller, members of Cameron
Council on Aging.

CAMERON COMMUNICATIONS Public Relations
Coordinator Trina Johnson presented a check for $500
to Hackberry Golf Team for winning the state champi-
onship. The check will be used to purchase champi-
onship rings for the golf team. Shown with Johnson are
Coach Terry Murphy and Hunter Stansel.

Johnson Bayou Library silkworm exhibit

Older Americans Month
proclaimed by Governor

May has been proclaimed
as Older Americans Month
by Gov. Bobby Jindal, accord-
ing to Dinah Landry, director
of the Cameron Council on
Aging. The proclamation
reads in part:

Our older citizens
promise to be among the
most active and engaged
older adult populations in
our Nation’s history.

It is the responsibility of
communities to work togeth-
er and prepare for changing
older adult populations by
modernizing systems of care

and providing consumers
with more control over their
lives.

Overall quality of life can
be greatly enhanced when
supportive communities help
their older citizens obtain
evidence-based approaches
to making behavioral
changes that can reduce risk
of disease, disability, and
injury and the tools to make
informed decisions about,
and gain better access to,
existing health and long-
term care options.

MARINES
Cont. from Pg. 1
while establishing an ammo
dump at a reservoir in north-
ern Korea. The base was sur-
rounded by 20 Chinese divi-
sions. “Every one of us had
frostbite. Some were evacu-
ated, some were not, but all
the survivors suffer from the
effects of the elements
today,” Monk says.

McLeod's article in The
Old Breed News, the division
newsletter, quotes Monk as
saying, “We would see
Corsairs drop napalm bombs
on the hills around us. After
the explosion and ensuing
fire, Chinese forces would
rush into the area to warm
themselves.”

Monk was just as proud of
his Marines as they are of
him. “They could move
ammo; they could move a
mountain if they were
turned loose. They are truly
like brothers.” He says
Richard was the company
“procurement specialist,”
who acquired necessary sup-
plies and equipment. “The
Army was pretty well sup-
plied, but the Marines not so
well. John got what we need-
ed, legal or not”

Monk retired from the
active military in 1964, and
after 4 years in the reserves
got his 30 year pin in 1968.
He jokes that even though
the men of Monk's Raiders
call him the “old man,” they
are catching up quickly.

Marine veterans, some in
wheelchairs, came from
California, Massachusetts,
Florida, Michigan, Nevada,
Virginia, Arkansas,
Kentucky, Texas, Tennessee,
and Louisiana to meet with
their leader and share sto-
ries, good food and a good
time on the bank of the
Mermentau River. 

The veterans, aged 78 to
89, have met in places like
Virginia Beach, Biloxi,
Kansas City, and
Wilmington, North Carolina,
but this year Richard offered
to host them at Armand
Richard's camp. They group
arrived in Lake Charles on
Wednesday, May 21, and
were met by Calcasieu
Parish District Attorney
John Derosier, himself a
Marine veteran. They pro-
ceeded by charter bus to
Grand Chenier for a crab,
shrimp, and crawfish boil.
Cameron Parish Clerk of
Court Carl Broussard was on
hand to greet them.

Music and fun were pro-
vided by a group of locals
calling themselves the “May
Marine Mardi Gras” crewe,
organized by Melba Trahan.
Cameron Parish Registrar of
Voters Suzanne Sturlese said
they wanted to give a taste of

Mardi Gras to visitors from
out of state who have never
experienced it.

They wore costumes, gave
away beads, danced and gen-
erally clowned around, to the
delight (and amazement) of
the guests. Veteran J. J. Tefft
said it was the best reunion
they have ever had. His voice
filled with emotion, he said,
“I want the people here to
know how much this means
to us guys, it is incredible,
the cap of our lives.”

John and Kitty Richard
had a lot of help in putting
on the reunion. They
thanked Jared LaBove,
David Dimas, Ronald
Dupuis, Doody LaBove,
Cindy LaBove, and Carmen
Dimas for helping with the
food, which also included
brisket, roast chicken, rice
dressing “like Mama used to
make” and all the trim-
mings.

Members of the Crewe
were Melba Trahan, Ronald
Dupuis, Suzanne Sturlese,
Christa Richard, Nina Jones,
Kathy Richard Abshire,
Diane Richard Benson, Lynn
Richard LaBove, and Ivy
LeBoeuf.

Silkworms
are featured
at JB Library

Johnson Bayou Library
announces this schedule of
events for the coming week: 

Friday, May 30,
Children’s Story Hour 10-11
a.m.; Movie Time 1:30-3:30
p.m.

Monday, June 2, Adult
Book Club 2 p.m..

Wednesday, June 4, Blast
Off to Summer Reading:
Games, Crafts,
Refreshments, & Story time
10 a.m.

Thursday, June 5,
Silkworm Adventure 10-11
a.m. Come join in the first
adventure with silkworms!
You will get to know all
about silkworms and read
the story, “The Empress and
the Silkworms”. Over a 40
day period, there will be a
program for each stage of the
silkworm transformation.

asasasasa

BByy  CCOOUURRTTNNEEYY  TTAANNAABBEE

Because of you, I am here
Because of you, I am able

to live freely
Yet I do not know you
And I have not done any-

thing for you
But there you stand,

ready to fight
And there you are pre-

pared to die for me
You've fought before
And you'll fight again
For someone you don't

know
So thank you Unknown

Soldier
For fighting for me
I'm here because of you
And I owe my future to

you

Because of You, Unknown Soldier
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Thib’s Electrical
Electrical Contractor
State License #45542
Bonded & Insured

• Residential & Commercial
• Remodels & Service Work

— FREE ESTIMATES —
Danny Thibodeaux, Owner

(337) 661-1071 Email: thibselectric@gmail.com

Happy Ads
ARE HERE

AGAIN!!

New
BabyGood

Luck

Bon
V
o
y
a
g
e

Price
Includes

Photo and
Art-Work. 

Mail your request
along with photo 

and payment
by 4 p.m. Monday to

P. O. Box 995, DeQuincy, La.
70633. Ads must be signed.

Place A Happy
Ad For As Little

As

$$22445500

• Birthday
• Anniversary
• Promotion
• League

Championship
• Graduation
• New Baby
• BonVoyage
• Good Luck
• Engagement
• Wedding
• New Home

Congratulations! You’ve found a terrific way to send
your best wishes to someone special for any occasion!

The Cameron Pilot
Call or come by now and make someone’s day!

786-8004 or Toll Free: 1-800-256-7323

The Johnson Bayou Recreation Center
Will Host The

OPENING OF THE POOL PARTY
Sunday, June 1 at 3:00 p.m.

Refreshments will be served from 
3:00-6:00 .m. and the Pool will be

open from 3:00 - 7:00 p.m.

The pool will officially be open starting
Friday, May 30 but the actual

celebration will be Sunday, June 1

—POOL HOURS —
• Sunday -- 3:00 p.m. - 7:00 p.m.

• Closed Mondays
• Tuesday -- 3:00-7:00 p.m. General Public

7:00-8:00 p.m. Ladies night for 18 & over!!!!
• Wednesday -- 3:00 p.m. - 7:00 p.m.
• Thursday -- 3:00 p.m. - 7:00 p.m.

• Friday -- 3:00 p.m. - 7:00 p.m.
• Saturday & Sunday -- 2:00 p.m. - 7:00 p.m.

Southwest Homes
436-5593 or 1-800-256-8006

Why Buy Locally?

• Largest Housing retailer in SWLA
• Exclusive Trane A/C in all homes
• In House Service Department
• Over 200 models to choose from
• We handle SBA Loans
• We assist with Road Home Programs
• All homes exceed Cameron Parish

Building Codes
• We have been in business over 20 years

500 S. M. L. King Hwy . •  Lake Charles, LA

BOOTH’S GROCERY in Grand Chenier is nearing completion. Mrs. T-Mae Booth
vowed to rebuild after Hurricane Rita and plans to live in the back of the store when
complete, sometime later in the summer. (Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)

WORK HAS finally begun on the East Annex on Courthouse Square in Cameron.
Lewing Construction started dirt work at the site of the former Police Jury Annex on
Tuesday. The bid was approved on April 7. (Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)

June 16 deadline to apply
for funds to raise houses

BByy  DDAAVVIIDD  HHAAMMMMEERR
((TTiimmeess  PPiiccaayyuunnee))

Louisiana homeowners
have until June 16 to return
forms to the state indicating
they're interested in as much
as $60,000 for raising their
houses.

The state of Louisiana
said recently that it has
mailed 109,000 survey pack-
ets to eligible Road Home
applicants in the flood plain.
The packets contain ques-
tionnaires about applicants'
plans to raise their homes
and forms to sign if they

want to participate in one or
both of the elevation pro-
grams offered.

The state has $1 billion to
run the first program, a flat
$30,000 grant for most appli-
cants as part of the larger
Road Home rebuilding effort.
Louisiana also got $750 mil-
lion from FEMA to run a sec-
ond program as a reimburse-
ment for as much as $30,000
in additional elevation costs.

Returning the forms does-
n't guarantee a grant and
doesn't obligate the home-
owner to elevate, but the
state said it needed a clear

gauge of applicants' interest
in the programs and how
much money will be needed.

"Elevation is the corner-
stone to rebuilding our
homes safer and stronger,"
said Paul Rainwater, the
Louisiana Recovery
Authority executive director.

But the elevation pro-
grams haven't always been
the state's focus -- the Road
Home froze all elevation pay-
ments for more than a year
because of a budget crunch --
and some applicants who say
they're still waiting for the
mail packets are worried
about the new deadline.

"I have stopped all work
on my home because I can't
go any further until I get the
elevation money to raise my
house," said Debra Turner, a
Road Home applicant from
Lake Charles. "So, what do I
do now? When do I get my
letter? The deadline is June
16? I can't understand what
is going on with the Road
Home program."

Ghislaine Hegarty, who
wants to rebuild her
Lakeview home of 55 years,
also is still waiting. She said
program officials told her to
wait another week for the
packet to arrive in the mail,
which would give her about
two weeks to respond.

Any Road Home applicant

who thinks he or she is eligi-
ble for elevation assistance
and hasn't yet received the
documents should call the
state's Elevation Technical
Assistance toll-free hotline
at 1 (877) 234-1513, officials
said.

The first Road Home ele-
vation grant program pays
$30,000 for stick-built homes
and $20,000 for mobile
homes. Recipients must
agree to use the money to
raise their homes above the
level set in local or base flood
elevation standards. 

But many applicants in
the flood plain are unlikely
to select the grant if they are
selling their home, repairing
a home that is already ele-
vated or can't afford addi-
tional out-of-pocket costs to
raise the house.

The second pot of eleva-
tion money comes from the
Federal Emergency
Management Agency's
Hazard Mitigation Grant
Program, or HMGP. It is a
reimbursement program,
with payments available
after work is completed.

The state expects 22,000
homeowners to select that
option. Signing the Elevation
Incentive Form or the
HMGP Award Form to show
interest in landing assis-
tance will not compromise
anyone's right to appeal the
rest of a Road Home grant,
said Christina Stephens,
spokeswoman for the state
agencies overseeing Road
Home.

Language in another part
of the packet had raised con-
cerns that participating in
elevation programs would
nullify any pending Road
Home appeals. A portion of
the agreement that partici-
pants eventually must sign
includes an acknowledgment
that all Road Home appeals
"have concluded."

The state said that was
only intended to ensure that
elevation grants are paid
after all appeals are com-
plete, to make sure nobody
gets more than the maxi-
mum $150,000.

Louis LaCour Jr., an
appellate lawyer and Road
Home applicant, called the
state's argument for the lan-
guage "foolish" and said it
must be changed. But he
said that shouldn't be an
impediment to people sign-
ing the preliminary forms to
meet the June 16 deadline.

David Hammer can be
reached at dhammer@time-
spicayune.com or 504-826-
3322.

Veterans names sought
for monument extension

BByy  CCYYNNDDII  SSEELLLLEERRSS

Names of Cameron
Parish military veterans are
needed for the expansion of
the Veteran's Wall monu-
ment located at the Cameron
Court House.

The committee asks that
all veterans not currently
named on the wall contact
Samantha Hunt at 725-5316
or 853-5298; DaDa LaBove
at 802-1200; or Carl Faulk at
997 Marshall St., Cameron,
LA 70631. Name, rank, and
branch of service are needed.

Any Cameron Parish resi-
dent that has served in the
military can be listed.
Family members can turn in
the names if the veteran can-
not do so personally.

The Wall currently holds
six bronze plaques with
names of Cameron Parish
veterans, but there have
been at least three conflicts
since it was built, and the
committee wants to update
the list. Space was allowed
for two more plaques, which
are being designed now.

The existing plaques will

be moved over to make room
for the new ones, and new
plants and flags will be
installed. It is urgent that
names be submitted soon so
that the new plaques can be
cast.

This is your 
Louisiana.

© 2008 The Louisiana Department of 
Culture, Recreation & Tourism

Cane River
Green Market

Natchitoches, LA
May 3, 10, 17, 24, 31
Call (318) 238-7500

www.canerivergreenmarket.com
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You’re Invited. . .
Grand Lake Community Church would like

to invite you to worship with us Sunday morn-
ings at 10:00 a.m. and Wednesday evenings at
6:30 p.m.
We are located at 205 Hebert Trailer Park Rd.

(the red house with the red roof). 
Children’s Church is provided on Sunday

morning from 10:00 a.m. until 11:00 a.m. 
This is a Southern Baptist Mission from First

Baptist Moss Bluff.
For more information please contact:

Bro. Mike Paris at 438-2313 Attention Brides!
Why Drive? We’ll Come 
To You For Wedding
Invitations!!!

Jeffra DeViney
Sales Consultant

Ask 
About
FREE

Napkins
Offer!!

Personalized Service
In Your Home, Offering
The Perfect Wedding &
Social Stationery by. . .

Tru, Carlson Craft
And Birchcraft

WEEKEND AND EVENING

APPOINTMENTS AVAILABLE!!

Wise Ideas
Call: (337) 912-5063

WWee’’llll  BBuuiilldd
YYoouurr  BBaacckkyyaarrdd
PP AA RR AA DD II SS EE

(337) 583-2366

FREE
Getaway Package

For Two - Las Vegas -
Reno -Lake Tahoe
With Purchase of

Pool!!
Call for Details

BRETT GRIFFITH, a
senior at Grand Lake High
School, proudly displays
the 7 lb., 7 oz. bass that he
caught in the Lacassine
pool several weeks ago.
He is the son of Hallie and
Lisa Griffith of Grand
Lake.

(Photo by Pete Young.)

ABOUT 75 SENIORS attended the Cameron Council on Aging's annual Senior
Citizen Day, held last Friday at the Grand Lake Fireman Center. Music was provided
by the Medicare Playboys. AmeriCorps volunteers helped serve the meal.

(Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)

THE 2008-09 Grand Lake FFA Officers are (back row, from left) Lance Beard,
Sentinel; Kallan Mudd, Treasurer; LaRayne Picou, Vice President,; Samantha
Williams, President; (front row) Alysha Hackler, Reporter; and Kirstyn Vincent,
Secretary.

CHAPTER DEGREE recipients at the recent Grand Lake High School FFA awards
program were, from Left: James Schiele, Trevor Russell, Andrew Overmyer, Jade
Miller, Alex Myers, Shawnee Pearce, LaRayne Picou, and Kirstyn Vincent. Not pic-
tured were Matthew Hebert, Blake Madison, Micah Richard, Lakeyn Thomas, and
Jenna Conner.

THE GRAND LAKE High School FFA Livestock
Judging Team won first Place Area III and tied for
eighth/ninth place at the state competition. Shown
above are (front row, from left) LaRayne Picou, Kirstyn
Vincent; (back row) Kallan Mudd, and Lance Beard.

STATE DEGREE Recipients at the recent Grand Lake
High School FFA awards event were, from left, Kayla
Savoie, Samantha Williams, and Levi Stephenson.

GREENHAND DEGREE Recipients at the recent Grand Lake FFA awards program
were: (back row, from left) Cameron Ashfield, Jason Ferriss, Alysha Hackler, Kade
Meaux, Javen Little, Jace Perry, Julia Quinn, Jed Williams, Jonathan Quinn; (front
row) Robin Tolbert, Daniel Chaisson, Lance Beard, Joeanna Gaspard, Kallan Mudd,
Justin Sullivan, Matthew Thibodeaux, and Blake Widcamp. Not pictured were
Garrett Allen, Hunter Berkey, Cade Breaux, Lex Conner, and Victoria Roach.

Cameron
Outdoors
By LOSTON MCEVERS

““MMEEMMOORRIIAALL DDAAYY””
Today is Memorial Day, as

I write this and I think of all
our service men and women
who are overseas serving our
country. These men and
women really need our
prayers. As I look at the
prayer list, I see, yes he or she
loves hunting and enjoys a day
out on the water, skiing, boat
riding, crabbing and yes fish-
ing. Then I see those whose
families are shrimpers, know-
ing very well that they would
enjoy all these outings, if they
were here.

We can count all our bless-
ing, as we can go out and enjoy
Memorial Day, thanks to those
who are not able to be home,
doing a job that lets us enjoy
this Memorial Day with fami-
ly and friends.

JJUUNNEE  NNEEAARRSS
For the hunting folks, it’s

time to start browntop millet
planting for doves. We’ll see
the first day of summer June
21. However our temperatures
are already creeping up.

Hunters and fishermen
and women need to renew
your licenses, as they will
expire June 30.

CCCCAA’’ss  SSTTAARR  
TTOOUURRNNAAMMEENNTT

A new year brings new
changes as the CCA Louisiana
Statewide Tournament and
Anglers Rodeo (STAR) begins
it’s 14th year. This is the sec-
ond year that a 2008 STAR
registered angler to land a
tagged redfish, will win a new
chevy silverado pickup truck
valued at $30,000.

The STAR tournament cov-
ers the entire Louisiana coast,
and is one of the largest and
richest saltwater fishing tour-
naments in the country with

101 days of competition, May
24 through Labor Day, Sept. 1.

There’s a Ladies Only
Division as well as a youth
division; then the men’s divi-
sion. The speckle trout divi-
sion has two competitive peri-
ods; first day - May 24-July 13;
second half July 14-Sept 1.
There is one winner from each
coastal zone (west-central-
east) per competitive periods.

Other new divisions as the
King Mackerel, paddle craft
and largemouth bass. The
paddlecraft gives fisherman in
a non-motorized vessel a place
to compete. There is a lemon
fish division, as well as floun-
ders.

Boat packages will be
awarded to the largest fish
divisions for speckle trout,
flounder, lemon fish, paddle-
craft and Ladies only division.
Tackle package for Dorado
and King Mackerel divisions,
and four boat packages for the
youngsters. Tagged redfish,
besides the chevy trucks, will
have nine rigged Mako boats
for the other nine places. Fifty
redfish were released with the
first ten caught as winners.

CCOONNTTEESSTT  DDAATTEESS
Gibbstown tournaments

each Monday evening 5 p.m.
at Big Lake/Calcasieu Point
on Thursday 5 p.m. June 7 -
Evans P. Mhire KC’s Redfish
and Speckle Trout shootout at
Grand Chenier Park June 7;
23rd annual Lake Charles
CCA - Citgo Trout shootout
June 7; Lemesche Bass Club
Bass Tournament June 14 and
the McDonalds Big Bass
splash on Toledo Bend June
20-22.

MMEERRCCUURRYY  LLIINNKK
Recent research indicates

exposure to high levels of

Mercury in the environment
may impair the immune sys-
tems of largemouth bass.

Thus making the fish more
vulnerable to diseases, para-
sites and even predators.

1. Exercise regularly to
not only maintain weight,
but also decrease the sever-
ity of  hot flashes.

2. Avoid caffeine and alco-
hol, especially around bed-
time. Both can increase the
frequency of hot flashes and
night sweats and can cause
sleep problems.

3. Try keeping a to-do list
to keep you organized and
on track of your daily tasks.
Exercise your mind through
word-association games,

such as crossword puzzles,
to improve your memory.

4. Establish healthy sleep
habits, including getting
seven to eight hours of sleep
each night.

5. If you are experiencing
sleep problems, talk to your
doctor about a solution
that’s right for you. Options
include: lifestyle/behavioral
changes; sleep hygiene; and
prescription/OTC sleep
aids.

Five “Red Hot” Tips
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Home with 40 acres near Welsh. Comfortable 2200
feet, 3 bedroom, 2 bath home with sewing room
and fireplace. This includes an outdoor kitchen and
a barn. Beautiful live oaks and more. Asking
$275,000.

Please call The ProGroup today for your 
appointment. 337-734-3533

— NOTICE —
The Johnson Bayou Recreation Center will be accept-

ing applications for a Maintenance Helper. Any persons
who may be interested in applying can pick up an appli-
cation at the recreation center during normal operating
hours. (Sunday - Saturday 3 - 8 p.m.) Applications must
be turned in before 8:00 p.m.on Monday June 16, 2008.
For any additional information you may contact Christen
Trahan @ 337-304-4622

RUN: May 29, June 5, 12 (M 64)

Swarm alarm.
The termites are coming.

Call 478-7826
McKenziePestControl

THE HOME PROTECTORS

mckenziepestcontrol.com
Keith Dubrock, Owner • 717 Gulf Street, Lake Charles

Serving Southwest 
Louisiana Since 1951

Specializing in: 
INSUL-SOY

Soybean Based Open & Closed Cell Spray Foam
• Spray Foam for New Homes • Re-Models & Upgrades  
• Storage Buildings   • Under Floor of Elevated Homes 

• Coolers • Vessel Ice Compartments and More
— FREE ESTIMATES —

Clifton & Carryl Hebert, Owners

Bus.:  (337) 630-9027  Home:  (337) 598-4790
Pager: (337) 421-8382

Sales & Service __ New & Used
We Service All Makes & Models

In Lake Charles

Shetler Lincoln Mercury
3201 HWY. 14478-1720 Or 1-800-460-5461

Classifieds
RREEAALL EESSTTAATTEE

CENTURY21 BESSETTE
Realty, Inc., Office: 337-474-
2185, Grace Robideaux,
Realtor: 496-1611

•HEBERT CAMP ROAD
lots: Tract 3&4 $25,500,
Tract 1 $22,500

•10962 HWY 384: 3/2
Modular home w/additions
on 17.5 + acres. Owner will
look at all offers $275,000

•2321 MALLARD ST.-
Holly Beach lot fronting Hwy
82 & Mallard $68,900

•169 GRANGER LANE: 4
acres w/shop pad, electricity,
and mechanical system.
$64,000.

•229 McCAIN: Acadian
4/2 in Grand Lake in
restricted subdivision
w/large upstairs game room
$219,000. 2/13tfc.

•20 ACRES of timberland
for sale in Oretta,
Beauregard Parish.
Southwest of intersection of
Oklahoma Ave. and 7th St.
Call Darlene with Coldwell
Banker Elite at (337) 274-
2466. 3/5nc

HOLMWOOD: 3896 liv-
ing, 4br/4ba, 1.2 acres, game-
room, fireplace, sunroom,
30x70 shop, pool, metal roof,
Bell City school, $285,000
call 540-9441. 4/30 - 5/21p

FFOORR SSAALLEE

METAL OUTLET Metal
Roofing ~ Carports ~ Metal
Buildings ~ Patio Cover Kits
~ C’s & Z’s ~ Custom Trim ~
RV & Equipment Covers ~
Metal Doors ~ Windows. 337-
625-2778. 2241 E. Napoleon,
Sulphur. Open Mon.-Fri. 7
am-5 pm, Sat. 7 am-12 noon.
tfc.

MUST SELL: Steel
building from 2007 inventory
cancellations. One is 30 x 42,
freight paid to Louisiana. All
steel kit delivered to your job
site. 1-800-552-8504. 5/24 -
6/4p.

ATTRACT ATTENTION:
Need promotional items for
trade shows, festivals, fairs,
school events, etc. Call us, we
can help! Rely on Wise Ideas
Printing & Promotions to help
you develop a customized pro-
gram for your next event.
Check out our website:
www.bestwiseideas.com. Call
Jeffra Wise DeViney for com-
petitive quotes & sales cata-
logs. Phone: 912-5063. 

MOBILE HOME To Be
Moved 2004 16x80 signature
SH/127 3 bedroom, 2 bath,
secret room, 52x24' overhang
front and back porch.
Excellent condition, very
clean asking price $39,000
call anytime (337)598-5190
or 802-5528 5/7 - 5/29p.

SPECIAL!

Call For Other Great Deals

Wise Ideas
PRINTING 

& PROMOTIONS

$299
Ea.

Min. as low as
72 Ct.

Stainless Steel
Travel Mug
CCuussttoommiizzeedd  WWiitthh

YYoouurr  LLooggoo!!

Need
Promotional

Products

WE CAN
HELP!!!

Check Us Out At. . .
www.bestwiseideas.com

Call
JEFFRA

DEVINEY

912-5063

SPECIAL!
KOOZIES Customized
with your name or for
special events such as...

Weddings, Family or
School Reunions,

Safety Awards, Etc.

Check Us Out At. . .
www.bestwiseideas.com

Low Min.250 Ct.Choose from 13 Colors59¢ Ea.

Call For Other Great Deals

Wise Ideas
PRINTING 

& PROMOTIONS
Call

JEFFRA
DEVINEY

912-5063

Sheriff’s
Arrest
Report

The Cameron Parish
Sheriff ’s Dept. has
announced the following
arrests made May 20-27:

Artemio Garcia, 30,
Illegal Alien.

Feliz Zavala, 35, No
Driver License in USA,
Speeding.

John Paul Trahan, 27,
Bench Warrant, Issue
Worthless Checks.

Lloyd S. Trotter, 28, Issue
Worthless Checks (5 counts)

Terrance Joseph Vezinat,
27, Unauthorized Use of a
Moveable.

Talesha Chauntelle Pugh,
27, Simple Battery.

Kara Mydwn Thibodeaux,
27, Remain after Forbidden.

Dillon Patrick
Thibodeaux, 19, Public
Intoxication, Battery of a
Police Officer.

Shane Ray Thibodeaux,
39, Public Intoxication,
Remain after Forbidden.

Brad Ray Thibodeaux, 33,
Public Intoxication, Remain
after Forbidden, Battery of a
Police Officer.

Elvin Bryant Jinks, 41,
Domestic Abuse Battery.

Mark Carrier, 46,
Possession of CDS IV.

Damon Troy Spoon, 30,
Bench Warrant.

Allen Paul Conner, 24,
Possession of CDS II,
Probation Violation.

Christopher Boudreaux,
23, D.W.I., Careless
Operation, Driving Under
Suspension, Possession of
CDS III, Possession of
Marijauana, Probation
Violation.

Kandas Bertrand, 20,
Bench Warrant.

Christopher Alan
Hardwick, 26, Bench
Warrant.

ON WEDNESDAY, May 7 Grand Lake High School held a special celebration “Sock Hop” for all students in 1st-
12th grades who met their Accelerated Reader goal. Graduating seniors Kent Gauthreaux and Marcus Guintard
were the D. J.s.

THE STAR CHAPTER Farmer award was presented
to LaRayne Picou by Chapter Vice President Marcus
Guintard (right) at the Grand Lake FFA awards ceremo-
ny.

LANCE BEARD, left, was the recipient of the Star
Greenhand award at the recent Grand Lake High
School FFA awards program. Vice President Marcus
Guintard made the presentation.

KALLAN MUDD won
first place at the district
level in Creed Speaking,
second place in Area III
competition, and will com-
pete at the state level this
June.

Guilty pleas are entered
in Cameron District Court

Several individuals
recently entered guilty pleas
to felony charges in 38th
Judicial District Court
according to Cecil Sanner,
District Attorney. Assisting
in the prosecution were
Jennifer Jones and Tom
Barrett, Assistant District
Attorneys. Pleas entered are
through February 2008.
They are:

Aaron Paul Fuselier,
Possession of Marijuana-3rd
Offense, 7 years in prison,
suspended all but 6 months;
supervised probation for 3
years; $2,000.00 fine plus
costs of court. 

Glenn Roger, Sale,
Distribution or Possession of
Legend Drug without
Prescription, 5 years in
prison; suspended 4 years;
serve 1 year in Parish jail;

Jonathan Guilbeau, fail-
ure to pay child support, 45
days in Parish jail;

Jeremy K. DeBarge, Theft;
5 years in prison; suspended;
3 years supervised proba-
tion; $2,000.00 fine plus
costs of court;

Kenneth DeBarge, Theft; 5
years in prison; suspended; 3
years supervised probation;
$2,000.00 fine plus costs of
court;

James Thompson, Jr.,
Theft; 5 years in prison; sus-
pended; 3 years supervised
probation; $2,000.00 fine
plus costs of court;

Jeremy Dukes, CDS II; 3
years in prison, suspended; 3
years supervised probation;
$1,000.00 fine plus costs of
court;

Dennis Plummer, Sale,
Distribution or Possession of
Legend Drug without
Prescription; 3 years in
prison, suspended; 3 years
supervised probation;
$2,000.00 fine plus costs of
court.

Chad Broussard, CDS III
& IV; 5 years in prison, serve
3 years, suspend 2 years; 3
years supervised probation
upon release from prison;
pay court costs;

Jordan Sarvaunt,
Possession of CDS - 2 counts,
5 years in prison, consecu-
tive to previous sentence in
Calcasieu Parish;

Keith Daniel Richardson,
Unauthorized entry of an
inhabited dwelling; 3 years
in prison, serve 7 months in
Parish Jail, suspend 29
months; 3 years unsuper-
vised probation;

Michael Oliver, Possession
of CDS IV, 2 years super-
vised probation, $2000.00
fine plus costs of court;

Isaac Jeffers, Probation
Violation, Possession of CDS
Cocaine, probation revoked,
serve 2 years in prison;

Trent Michael Trahan,
Simple Burglary of an
Inhabited Dwelling - 2
counts; 1 count of Simple
Burglary; 5 years in prison,
suspended; 5 years super-
vised probation; $2000.00
fine plus costs of court; resti-
tution of $1300.00.

Clinton James Bertrand,
Probation Violation, Simple
Burglary, probation revoked,
serve 5 years in prison, with
credit for time served;

Jason E. Morlewski,
Theft, 10 years in prison,
suspended 4 years, serve 6
years; upon release from
prison 5 years supervised
probation; $1000.00 fine plus
costs of court;

Jason E. Morlewski,
Possession of CDS II, 5 years
in prison, to run concurrent
with Theft charges; 

Darrell Wayne Fruge,
Theft, 3 years in prison, sus-
pended, 3 years supervised
probation; $500.00 plus court
costs; restitution of
$6000.00;

Ricky Dale Dietz, Jr.,
Probation Violation,
Possession of CDS III, proba-
tion revoked; serve 6 months
in Parish jail; upon release
supervised probation for 1
year and 6 months; pay fine
and court costs;

Willie K. LaSalle,
Probation Violation,
Possession of CDS II, proba-
tion revoked; serve 5 years in
prison;

Christopher Lee Trahan,
Probation Violation,
Possession of CDS III, proba-
tion revoked; serve 3 years in
prison;

James Frederick Sennette,
Illegal Possession of Stolen
Things; 2 years supervised
probation; $1000.00 fine plus
costs of court;

Drew Anthony Badon,
Probation Violation,
Possession of CDS IV, proba-
tion revoked, serve 3 years in
prison; 

Marty James LeBlanc, Jr.,
Probation Violation,
Possession of Marijuana -
2nd Offense; probation
revoked; serve 3 years in
prison; 

Marty James Leblanc, Jr.,
Possession of CDS II; 4 years
in prison; to run consecutive
to probation violation of 3
years, for a total of 7 years;

Malori Ruth Hickey,
Probation Violation, Simple
Burglary, probation revoked
under 893, serve 3 years in
prison suspended, 3 years
probation; pay $500 fine plus
court cost;

Brad Abshire, Possession
of CDS III, 18 months proba-
tion; pay $2000 fine plus
court cost

Billy C. Wigley, Possession
of CDS II; 3 years in prison
suspended; 3 years proba-
tion; $ 2000 fine plus court
cost

Matthew J. Lefleur,
Possession of CDS III; 3
years in prison suspended; 3
years probation; $ 2000 fine
plus court cost

Allen Paul Conner,
Possession of CDS II and
Possession of CDS IV; 3
years probation; serve 45
days in parish jail on each
charge concurrent $ 1500
fine plus court cost

Julius J. Leblanc, Jr.,
Possession of CDS III; 3
years in prison suspended; 3
years probation; $ 2000 fine
plus court cost

Donald Eure, Possession
of CDS II; 3 years in prison
suspended; 3 years proba-
tion; $ 2000 fine plus court
cost

Jamie Andrews,
Attempted Possession of a
Firearm by Convicted Felon;
3 years in prison.

Make sure your
911 address
can be seen

The Cameron Parish
E911 Communication Board
is asking all resident and
business owners to place
their addresses in large let-
ters and numerals on their
homes, businesses or mail
boxes to enable responders to
find locations in emergencies
such as fire or request for an
ambulance.

The lettering should be
large enough where it can be
read from the road.

Reflective mail box post
signs are available through
the Cameron Council on
aging they can be contacted
at 905-6000.

For more information on
Cameron Parish Office of
Emergency Preparedness
call 775-7048.

This is your 
Louisiana.

© 2008 The Louisiana Department of 
Culture, Recreation & Tourism

Cane River
Green Market

Natchitoches, LA
May 3, 10, 17, 24, 31
Call (318) 238-7500

www.canerivergreenmarket.com
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NOTICE OF PUBLIC MEETING 
TO BE HELD FOR CAMERON PARISH

MOSQUITO ABATEMENT DISTRICT NO. 1
Notice is hereby given pursuant to Article 7, Section 23(C) of the

Constitution and R.S.47:1705(B) that a public hearing of the
Cameron Parish Mosquito Abatement District No. 1 will be held at
the regular meeting place, the Office of Cameron Parish Mosquito
Abatement District No. 1 at 146 Theriot Road, Sweetlake,
Louisiana, on Thursday, July 17, 2008 at 5:00 p.m. to consider
levying additional or increased millage rates without further voter
approval or adopting the adjusted millage rate and rolling forward
to a millage rate not to exceed the prior years’ maximum.

Questions concerning this matter may be addressed in writing or
by phone to Julian S. Robichaux, Director, Cameron Parish
Mosquito Abatement District No. 1, 146 Theriot Road, Bell City,
Louisiana 70630, Phone: (337) 905-5941.

RUN: May 22, 29 (M-43)

— PUBLIC NOTICE —

The Cameron Parish Assessor’s Office is currently
accepting resumes until 3:00 p.m. Friday, May 30,
2008. You may mail your resume to the following
address:

Cameron Parish Assessor’s Office, 
Attn: Mona Kelley, 

P. O. Box 1100, 
Cameron, LA 70631 

or drop it by at 119 Smith Circle, Room 24, Cameron,
LA.

The Cameron Parish Assessor’s Office does not dis-
criminate on the basis of race, color, age, sex, handi-
cap, national origin, political or religious opinions.

RUN: May 15, 22, 29 (M 16)

— NOTICE —
Cameron Parish Mosquito Abatement

District No. 1 is accepting applications
for part-time spray truck drivers. All
applicants must be 18 years of age
and have a valid driver’s license.

This is a seasonal position and work
depends upon mosquito populations
and weather conditions. Hours are
from dusk to dawn (nights). Hourly
pay is $10.00 per hour.

Applications must be filled out in per-
son at Mosquito Control Headquarters
located at 146 Theriot Road, Sweetlake,
Louisiana during office hours 7:30 a.m.
to 3:30 p.m. Monday to Friday. For more
information call 337-905-5941.

The Cameron Parish Mosquito
Abatement District No. 1 is an equal
opportunity employer and does not
discriminate based upon sex, race,
religion, ethnic origin, and/or political
affiliation.

RUN: May 22 & 29 (M-58)

CAMERON PARISH SCHOOL BOARD
2008-2009 Current Openings and New Positions

For all positions listed, applicants should download the appropriate application from
www.camsch.org; and schedule an interview with the contact person listed for the posi-
tion in which the applicant is interested. The applicant must submit the completed
application to the contact person at the time of the interview. Applicants interested in
itinerant positions involving two schools must schedule interviews with and provide
copies of application to both contact persons.

Grand Lake High School (5 day week) Contact: David Duhon, Principal (337) 905-
2231: School Librarian 1/2 day/Teacher, 1/2 day (2 positions available); Middle School
English/Language Arts Mild/Moderate Special Education School Nurse, LPN; Gifted
Itinerant (Grand Lake and South Cameron High Schools); Art Education Itinerant, non-
gifted (Grand Lake High School and South Cameron High Schools); School Nurse, RN
Itinerant (Grand Lake High School and South Cameron High Schools).

Hackberry High School (4 day week) Contact: Austin LaBove, Principal (337) 762-
3305: Pre-Kindergarten/Non-Categorical Combination; School Counselor; Family and
Consumer Science; Middle School/Secondary: English; Mathematics; Social Studies;
Mild/Moderate Special Education; Basketball Coach with Core Curriculum (2 posi-
tions); Sweeper; Art Education Itinerate, non-gifted (Hackberry High School and
Johnson Bayou High Schools); Gifted Itinerant (Hackberry High School and Johnson
Bayou High Schools); Adaptive Physical Education Itinerant (Hackberry High School
and Johnson Bayou High Schools); School Nurse, RN Itinerant (Hackberry High
School and Johnson Bayou High Schools).

Johnson Bayou High School (4 day week) Contact: Gene Reynolds, Principal (337)
562-2138: Pre-Kindergarten/Kindergarten Combination; Assistant Principal; Middle
School/Secondary: English; Mathematics; Science; Social Studies; Mild/Moderate
Special Education; Lower Elementary (2 positions); School Nurse, LPN; Art Education
Itinerate, non-gifted (Johnson Bayou High School and Hackberry High Schools); Gifted
Itinerant (Johnson Bayou High School and Hackberry High Schools); Adaptive
Physical Education Itinerant (Johnson Bayou High School and Hackberry High
Schools); School Nurse, RN Itinerant (Johnson Bayou High School and Hackberry
High Schools);

South Cameron High School (4 day week) Contact: Carol Wainwright, Principal
(337) 542-4628: Middle School/Secondary Science; Upper Elementary;
Severe/Profound Special Education; Mild/Moderate Special Education; Art Education
Itinerant, non-gifted (South Cameron High School and Grand Lake High Schools);
Gifted Itinerant (South Cameron High School and Grand Lake High Schools); School
Nurse, RN Itinerant (South Cameron High School and Grand Lake High Schools).

Other Positions (complete appropriate application and schedule interview as noted
above): Cafeteria Manager, Grand Lake High School; Lunchroom Technician, Grand
Lake High School; Contact: Cynthia Carpenter, School Food Service Supervisor, (337)
905-5784 ext 113; Principal, Hackberry High School; Contact: Stephanie D.Rodrigue,
Superintendent, Cameron Parish School Board,(337) 905-5784 ext 101.

Deadline for all applications is Thursday, June 5, 2008 at 12:00 Noon.

Available positions will continually be updated at www.camsch.org. Appointments
will be approved at monthly meetings of the Cameron Parish School Board

RUN: May 29 & June 5 (M-70)

LEGAL NOTICES
SHERIFF’S SALE

THIRTY-EIGHT JUDICIAL
DISTRICT COURT

PARISH OF CAMERON
STATE OF LOUISIANA
JEFF DAVIS BANK &

TRUST COMPANY
VS. NO. 10-18173

THOMAS O’NEIL BROWN
AND ANGIE NICOLE BROWN

By virtue of a writ of EXECU-
TORY PROCESS issued to me
directed by the Honorable Court
aforesaid, I have seized and will
offer for sale at public auction to
the last and highest bidder WITH
the benefit of appraisement, at
the Court House door of this
Parish of Cameron, on
Wednesday, June 04, 2008 at
10:00 a.m. the following
described property to-wit:

BEING THE WEST 95 O
FEET OF THE EAST 100 O
FEET OF LOT NINETEEN (19)
OF STORM HAVEN
SUBDIVISION PHASE II, A
SUBDIVISION PER PLAT OF
SURVEY BY KNAPP LAND
SURVEYING DATED
DECEMBER 10, 1985, FILED
FOR RECORD MARCH 11, 1986,
AND RECORDED IN BOOK 616
OF CONVEYANCES AT PAGE
477 AND IN BOOK 5 OF PLATS
AT PAGE 133 BEARING FILE
NUMBER 198659, RECORDS
OF CAMERON PARISH,
LOUISIANA, TOGETHER WITH
ALL IMPROVEMENTS THERE-
ON SITUATED. MUNICIPAL
ADDRESS: 146 KATHY DRIVE,
LAKE CHARLES, LA.
seized under said writ.

Terms: Cash day of sale.
/s/ Theos Duhon

Theos Duhon, Sheriff
CAMERON PARISH, LA.

Sheriff ’s Office, Cameron,
Louisiana April 11, 2008

STEPHEN C. POLITO 
Attorneys for JEFF DAVIS

BANK & TRUST COMPANY
RUN: May 1 & 29 (M 3)

LEGAL NOTICE
This is to advise that the

Cameron Parish Police Jury
meeting in regular session con-
vened on the 5th day of May 2008
accepted as complete and satis-
factory the work performed under
Project Number 2007-11: Post
Rita Restoration of Big Lake pier
pursuant to the certain contract
between K.A.S. Construction
LLC and said Cameron Parish
Police Jury under File No.
305686 in the Book of Mortgages,
Cameron Parish, Louisiana.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
that any persons having claims
arising out of the furnishing of
labor, supplies, material, etc., in
the construction of the said work
should file said claim with the
Clerk of Court of Cameron
Parish, Louisiana on or before
forty-five (45) days after the first
publication hereof, all in the
manner and form as prescribed
by law. After the elapse of said
time, the Cameron Parish Police
Jury will pay all sums due in the
absence of any such claims or
liens.
BY: Magnus Magee, President
RUN: May 8, 15, 22, 29 & June 5,
12, 19 (M 21)

AADDVVEERRTTIISSEEMMEENNTT  FFOORR
BBIIDDSS

Sealed proposals for the con-
struction of the following project
shall be received by the Cameron
Parish Police Jury until Monday,
June 2, 2008 until 1:00 PM at the
Police Jury Annex located at
122A Recreation Ln., Cameron,
LA 70631 (337-775-5719).

PPrroojjeecctt  NNuummbbeerr::  22000077--3344  
PPoosstt  RRiittaa  RReeccoonnssttrruuccttiioonn

ooff  tthhee  EEaasstt  CCaammeerroonn
MMaaiinntteennaannccee  FFaacciilliittyy  ((PPhhaassee
II))

The rules and regulations for
the state licensing board will
apply. The project is being classi-
fied as: 

Bids must be submitted on the
prescribed form. All blank spaces
for bid prices must be filled in
using ink, and in both words and
figures, with the unit price for the
item or the lump sum for which
the bid is made. The bidder shall
provide all information indicated
on the attached forms. Failure to
provide the information indicated
constitutes informality in the pro-
posal, rendering it subject to
rejection by the owner.

All bids must be submitted in
sealed envelopes bearing on the
outside the name of the project on
which the proposal is submitted.
If forwarded by mail, the sealed
envelope containing the proposal
and marked as directed above,
must be enclosed in another
envelope addressed as specified
in the proposal form, and prefer-
ably sent by registered mail.

For the purpose of award, the
product of the approximate quan-
tities of each item shown in the
proposal by their respective unit
prices will be considered the
amount of the bid on each item.
The correct summation of these
products will be the amount bid
on the entire work.

Proposal forms will not be
issued later than 24 hours prior
to the hour and date set for
receiving proposals. Every bid
submitted shall be accompanied
by a certified check or bid bond in
the amount of 5% of the bid and
shall be made payable to the
Cameron Parish Police Jury.

Full information and proposal
forms are available upon deposit
of $50.00 per set at the office of
the engineer 337-905-1079.

Lonnie G. Harper &
Associates, Inc.

2746 Highway 384
Bell City, LA 70630

Bids must be submitted on
proposal forms provided by the
engineer. Official action will be
taken at the regularly scheduled
Cameron Parish Police Jury
meeting. Cameron Parish Police
Jury reserves the right to reject
any or all the proposals and to
waive any informality. 

Cameron Parish Police Jury
/s/ Magnus McGee, President

RUN: May 15, 22, and 29 (M 31)

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS
Sealed proposals for the con-

struction of the following project
will be received by the Cameron
Parish Police Jury on MMoonnddaayy
JJuunnee  22,,  22000088 until 22::0000  PPMM at

CENTER; GRAND LAKE,
LOUISIANA

PRECINCT 12; PORTION;
MURIA FIRE STATION; CRE-
OLE, LOUISIANA

PRECINCT 13; PORTION;
CREOLE FIRE STATION; CRE-
OLE, LOUISIANA

PRECINCT 5; ALL; GRAND
LAKE RECREATION; GRAND
LAKE, LOUISIANA

NOTICE IS HEREBY FUR-
THER GIVEN that the said spe-
cial election will be held in accor-
dance with the provisions of the
Louisiana Election Code (Title 18
of the Louisiana Revised
Statutes), including Chapter 6-A
thereof, and other constitutional
and statutory authority supple-
mental thereto. Such officers
appointed to hold the said elec-
tion, and such substitutes there-
for as are selected and designated
in compliance with law, will make
due returns thereof to the Clerk
of Court of Cameron Parish and
to the Board of Commissioners of
Recreation District No. Five,
Cameron Parish, Louisiana, the
governing authority of said
District.

NOTICE IS HEREBY FUR-
THER GIVEN that the commis-
sioners-in-charge duly certified
by the Clerk of Court of Cameron
Parish and selected by the Parish
Board of Election Supervisors as
provided for in R.S. 18:433, as
amended, are hereby designated
as the commissioners-in-charge
to serve at the polling places des-
ignated in the election herein
called. The commissioners of elec-
tion and alternate commissioners
of election shall be appointed by
the Cameron Parish Clerk of
Court, in accordance with R.S.
18:1286, as amended. In the
event the election herein called is
held at the same time as the elec-
tion of public officials the com-
missioners and alternate com-
missioners shall be those com-
missioners and alternate com-
missioners selected for the elec-
tion of public officials, in accor-
dance with R.S. 18:1286, as
amended.

NOTICE IS HEREBY FUR-
THER GIVEN that the Board of
Commissioners of Recreation
District No. Five Cameron
Parish, Louisiana, the governing
authority of said District, will
meet at its regular meeting place,
the Recreation District No. Five
Recreation Center, Grand Lake,
Louisiana, on Thursday the 24th
day of July, 2008, at 6:30 PM, and
will then and there, in open and
public session, proceed to exam-
ine and canvass the returns as
certified by the Clerk of Court of
Cameron Parish, Louisiana, and
declare the result of the said spe-
cial election.

All registered voters of
Recreation District No. Five,
Cameron Parish, Louisiana are
entitled to vote at said special
election and voting machines will
be used in the conduct of the elec-
tion.

THUS DONE AND SIGNED
on this the 25th day of March,
2008.

APPROVED:
KIM NUNEZ, PRESIDENT 

RECREATION DISTRICT 
NO. FIVE

ATTEST:
LISA DUPUIE, SECRETARY
RUN: May 29, June 5, 12, 19 (M
42)

PROCEEDINGS
Parish of Cameron

April 14, 2008
The Cameron Parish School

Board met at its regular meeting
on this date, members in atten-

dance are: Karen Nunez, R. Scott
Nunez, Loston McEvers, Dot
Theriot, Dwayne Sanner and
Marsha Trahan; absent is:
Marvin Trahan.

The prayer and the pledge
were led by: Cloie Broussard,
Shelby Thomas, Rachael
Fountain.

On the motion of Mrs. Nunez,
seconded by Mr. Nunez, the
Board approved the agenda with
Addendum.

On the motion of Mr.
McEvers, seconded by Mrs.
Theriot, the Board approved the
minutes as printed from the
March 10, 2008 regular board
meeting.

The Board approved the fol-
lowing student recognitions:

Cameron Parish Students of
the Year - Mrs. Sheila Miller

Grade 5 Cloie Broussard,
Grand Lake High School

Grade 8 Shelby Thomas,
Grand Lake High School

Grade 12 Rachael Fountain,
South Cameron High School

Louisiana School Boards
Association Art Contest - Mrs.
Sharon Campbell, Art Teacher

Seaira Dupelchain, grade 4,
South Cameron High School,
Category K-4 Honorable Mention

Jada Skipper, grade 7, South
Cameron High School, Category
5-8 Honorable Mention

State Elementary Wrestling
Champions and Reserve
Champions - Superintendent

State Champions - Wyatt
Benoit, Grand Lake High School -
PreBantam 45 lb. Division

Trenton Comeaux, South
Cameron High School - Bantam
45 lb. Division

James “Pookie” Hebert,
South Cameron High School -
Midget 70 lb. Division

Jeron Theriot, South
Cameron High School - Novice 80
lb. Division

Joshua Wicke, Grand Lake
High School - Schoolboy 105 lb.
Division

State Runner-Ups:
Trevor Bertrand, South

Cameron High School - Novice 60
lb. Division

Tyler LaBove, South
Cameron High School - Novice
105 lb. Division

Kelan Nunez, South
Cameron High School - Bantam
55 lb. Division

Hayden Sturlese, Grand
Lake High School - Novice 100 lb.
Division

Coach: Gabe LaLande, Grand
Lake High and South Cameron
High Schools

On the motion of Mrs.
Trahan, seconded by Mrs.
Theriot, the Board authorized the
following individual $500.00
stipends for national participa-
tion, as per policy.

Grand Lake High School
FBLA - Corey Broussard,
Impromptu Speaking; Megan
Poole, Open Events Technology;
Evan Guidry, Open Events
Technology; to participate in
National FBLA Conference, June
26-29, 2008 in Atlanta, Georgia
(Dorothy Robinson, Sponsor, will
not attend - Grand Lake will
travel with South Cameron High
School Sponsor and group)
($1,500.00)

Hackberry High School FBLA
- Jacob Poole, Louisiana State
Officer; Joseph LeJuene,
Louisiana “Member of the
Month”; Stephanie East and
Kathy Helmer, Sponsors; to par-
ticipate in National FBLA
Conference, June 26-29, 2008 in
Atlanta, Georgia ($2,000.00)

Johnson Bayou High School
FLBA -Tiffany Caudill, Business
Procedures; Mrs. Juanita
Sandifer, Sponsor, to participate
in National FBLA Conference,
June 26-29, 2008 in Atlanta,
Georgia (Total: $1,000.00)

South Cameron High School
FBLA - Tony Baccigalopi,
Business Calculations; Janna
Baccigalopi, Sponsor; to partici-
pate in National FBLA
Conference, June 26-29, 2008 in
Atlanta, Georgia ($1,000.00)

South Cameron High School:
Corbet Dupont, selected to Junior
National Youth Leadership
Conference for outstanding 6th
and 7th grade students who
demonstrate maturity, academic
excellence and leadership poten-
tial
(Total $500.00)

On the motion of Mrs. Nunez,
seconded by Mr. McEvers, the
Board received and approved the
following financial issues:

Receive notice that portion of
remaining funds in District One
Johnson Bayou High School bond
issue will be used to construct a
softball field on Johnson Bayou
High School property.

Received, reviewed and dis-
cussed the March Financial
Report and authorize payment of
the bills as presented by Mrs.
Smythe (ATTACHMENT #1 and
#2)

Board approval of receipt of
verbal notice from FEMA on
March 28, 2008 to begin bid
processes:

the Cameron Parish Police Jury
Annex, 122A Recreation Ln.,
Cameron, LA (337-775-5719) 

PPrroojjeecctt  NNuummbbeerr::  22000077--2211
PPoosstt  RRiittaa  RReessttoorraattiioonn  ooff

tthhee  JJeettttyy  PPiieerr  FFaacciilliittyy  
The rules and regulations for

the State Licensing Board for
contractors will apply; the project
being classified as: 

II  BBuuiillddiinngg  CCoonnssttrruuccttiioonn  
VVII  MMeecchhaanniiccaall  WWoorrkk  
VVIIIIII  PPlluummbbiinngg  
VV  EElleeccttrriiccaall  WWoorrkk  
Bids must be submitted on

the prescribed form. All blank
spaces for bid prices must be
filled in, using ink and in both
words and figures, with the unit
price for the item or the lump
sum for which the bid is made.
The bidder shall provide all infor-
mation indicated on the attached
forms. Failure to provide the
information indicated constitutes
a informality in the proposal, ren-
dering it subject to rejection by
the owner. 

All bids must be submitted in
sealed envelopes bearing on the
outside the name of the project on
which the proposal is submitted.
If forwarded by mail, the sealed
envelope containing the proposal
and marked as directed above,
must be enclosed in another
envelope addressed as specified
in the proposal form, and prefer-
ably sent by registered mail. 

For the purpose of award, the
product of the approximate quan-
tities of each item shown in the
proposal by their respective unit
and/or lump sum prices will be
considered the amount of the bid
on each item. The correct summa-
tion of these products will be the
amount bid on the entire work. 

Proposal forms will not be
issued later than 24 hours prior
to the hour and date set for
receiving proposals. Every bid
submitted shall be accompanied
by a certified check or bid bond in
the amount of 5% of the bid and
shall be made payable to the
Cameron Parish Police Jury. 

Full information and propos-
al forms are available at the office
of Lonnie G. Harper & Associates,
Inc., 2746 Hwy 384, Bell City,
Louisiana 70630, (337) 905-1079.
Plans and specifications may be
inspected upon deposit of $50.00
per set. Bids must be submitted
on proposal forms provided by the
engineer. Official action will be
taken at the regularly scheduled
Cameron Parish Police Jury
meeting. The Cameron Parish
Police Jury reserves the right to
reject any or all the proposals and
to waive informality.

Cameron Parish Police Jury
/s/ Magnus McGee, President.

Runs: May 15, 22, 29 (M 35)

NOTICE OF
SPECIAL ELECTION

Pursuant to the provisions of a
resolution adopted by the Board
of Commissioners of Recreation
District No. Five, Cameron
Parish, Louisiana, the governing
authority of the District, on
March 25, 2008, NOTICE IS
HEREBY GIVEN that a special
election will be held in Recreation
District No. Five Cameron
Parish, Louisiana, on Saturday,
July 19, 2008, and that at said
election there will be submitted
to all registered voters of said
Parish qualified and entitled to
vote at the said election under
the Constitution and laws of the
State of Louisiana and the
Constitution and laws of the
United States, the following
Proposition, towit:

PROPOSITION
SUMMARY: AUTHORITY

FOR RECREATION DISTRICT
NO. FIVE TO COLLECT, FOR 10
YEARS, A TAX OF FIVE MILLS
PER ANNUM ON ALL PROPER-
TY SUBJECT TO TAXATION IN
SAID DISTRICT (AN ESTIMAT-
ED $80,000 REASONABLY
EXPECTED TO BE COLLECT-
ED FROM THE LEVY OF THIS
TAX FOR OPERATING AND
MAINTAINING SAID DIS-
TRICT’S RECREATION FACILI-
TIES WITHIN AND FOR SAID
DISTRICT.

Shall Recreation District No.
Five of the Parish of Cameron, be
authorized to levy a tax of
five(5.00)mills on the dollar of
assessed valuation on all proper-
ty subject to taxation in said
District (an estimated $80,000
reasonably expected to be collect-
ed from the levy of this tax per
annum) for a period of ten (10)
years, commencing with the year
2008, for the purpose of operating
and maintaining said District’s
Recreation facilities within and
for said District?

NOTICE IS HEREBY FUR-
THER GIVEN that said special
election will be held at the polling
places set forth below, all situated
within Recreation District No.
Five Cameron Parish, Louisiana,
which polls will open at six
o’clock (6:00) a.m. and close at
eight o’clock (8:00) p.m., in com-
pliance with the provisions of
Section 541 of Title 18 of the
Louisiana Revised Statutes of
1950, as amended (R.S. 18:541):

PRECINCT 16; PORTION;
GRAND LAKE RECREATION

Cont. on Page 8.



Medicaid $3,400.00;
$26,720.00

Equalization $533,932.00;
$4,582,983.00

Special Education $-;
$3,238.00

PIP $ -; $10,188.00
Other Restricted Revenues

$63,233.00; $1,161,229.00
Revenue Sharing $-;

$18,979.00
Other Restricted Revenues

State $-; $2,245,870.00
FEMA $55,250.00;

$4,685,461.00
Temporary Investments

$790,757.00; $-
Interfund Payable

$226,073.00; $-
Total Revenue $2,042,815.00;

$24,431,951.00
Cash Expenditures:
Monthly Payroll $971,003.00;

$7,386,435.00
Employee Benefits

$362,071.00; $3,081,381.00
Purchased Services

$10,543.00; $202,678.00
Pension Fund $-; $272,450.00
Architect Fees $5,900.00;

$576,490.00
Other Fees $16,743.00;

$65,635.00
Repairs and Maintenance

$38,264.00; $1,263,446.00
Insurance and Bonds

$22,205.00; $91,002.00
Telephone, Travel, Postage

$19,867.00; $114,779.00
Textbooks and Supplies

$44,542.00; $581,751.00
Utilities and Gasoline

$50,720.00; $373,004.00
Equipment, Furniture,

Buildings, Vehicles $29,691.00;
$976,852.00

Other Expenses $895.00;
$222,463.00

Temporary Investments $-;
$7,419,037.00

Year End Accrual $-;
$1,517,601.00

Total Cash Expenditures
$1,572,444.00; $24,145,004.00

Cash Balance, March 31,
2008 $1,297,298.00;
$1,297,298.00

ATTACHMENT #2
LAMP INVESTMENTS

FUND, TERM, RATE,
AMOUNT

DISTRICT #4 TAX, , 2.94%,
$380,979.49

DISTRICT #5 CONST, ,
2.94%, $59,668.26

DISTRICT #5 TAX, , 2.94%,
$426,347.44

DISTRICT #15 TAX, , 2.94%,
$352,668.06

WORKERS COMP, , 2.94%,
$103,375.57

DISTRICT #4 CONSTR, ,
2.94%, $92,357.93

16TH SECTION, , 2.94%,
$217,645.98

GENERAL FUND, , 2.94%,
$1,612,123.46

SPECIAL PROJECTS, ,
2.94%, $1,291,112.70

PROTEST TAX , 2.94%,
$1,713,047.83

TOTAL LAMP INVEST-
MENTS $6,249,326.72

CD INVESTMENTS
FUND, TERM, RATE,

AMOUNT, SUB TOTAL
CSB, 4945042, GENERAL

FUND, 180, 3.31%, $640,407.43
4947703, GENERAL FUND,

90, 2.86%, $331,636.52
CAP ONE, 1122670, GENER-

AL FUND, 180, 3.30%,
$1,000,000.00

CAP ONE, 1122669, GENER-
AL FUND, 152, 3.30%,
$1,000,000.00

CAP ONE, 1122668, GENER-
AL FUND, 120, 3.30%,
$1,000,000.00

1122667, GENERAL FUND,
90, 3.30%, $1,000,000.00

4947975, GENERAL FUND,
90, 2.78%, $520,815.31

CSB, 4949137, GENERAL
FUND, 90, 1.99%, $829,964.68

CAP ONE, 1122736, GENER-
AL FUND, 179, 2.78%,
$1,205,591.67

CSB, 4949102, GENERAL
FUND, 120, 1.61%, $1,222,410.14

CAP ONE, 1242188560,
GENERAL FUND, 180, 2.55%,
$1,002,750.00, $9,753,575.75

CSB, 4945190, 16TH SEC-
TION, 180, 2.91%, $871,713.42

CSB, 4945077, 16TH SEC-
TION, 180, 2.88%, $3,345,891.06

CSB, 4949110, 16TH SEC-
TION, 180, 1.25%, $2,087,123.78,
$6,304,728.26

CSB, 4947789, DISTRICT
#10 TAX, 240, 2.87%, $
265,000.00, $ 265,000.00

CAP ONE, 1122645,
PROTEST TAX, 182, 3.45%,
$1,698,760.37, $1,698,760.37

TOTAL CD INVESTMENTS,
$18,022,064.38

BOND INVESTMENTS
FUND, MATURITY, RATE,

AMOUNT, SUB TOTAL
313588YRO, GENERAL

FUND, 6/27/08, 5.05%,
$999,563.04

313588ZDO, GENERAL
FUND, 7/9/08, 3.75%,
$999,359.18

313396ZR7, GENERAL
FUND, 7/21/08, 5.05%,
$2,499,917.86

313396F99, GENERAL
FUND
9/15/08, 4.50%, $1,199,843.61

3128X4MQ1, GENERAL
FUND, 9/19/08, 4.48%,
$1,102,053.33

313396S53, GENERAL
FUND
12/8/08, 3.50%, $1,087,761.76

313397AE1, GENERAL
FUND, 1/5/09, 3.35%,
$999,594.16, 8,888,092.94

16TH SECTION, 5/23/08,
4.15%, $1,250,189.74

16TH SECTION, 11/17/08,
3.75%, $1,099,031.66

16TH SECTION, 4/15/09,
3.65%, $1,010,534.04,
3,359,755.44

TOTAL BOND INVEST-
MENTS, $12,247,848.38

UBS INVESTMENTS
FUND, MATURITY, RATE,

AMOUNT
EM1073670, GENERAL

FUND, 2/25/08, 3.03, $772,208.42
TOTAL ALL INVEST-

MENTS, $37,291,447.90
TOTAL INVESTMENTS

BY FUND
DISTRICT #4 TAX,

$380,979.49
DISTRICT #5 CONST,

$59,668.26
DISTRICT #5 TAX,

$426,347.44
DISTRICT #15 TAX,

$352,668.06
WORKERS COMP,

$103,375.57
DISTRICT #4 CONSTR,

RD, HACKBERRY
ALEXANDER JR, KEN-

NETH P, 110 BRIAN CIR,
GRAND LAKE

AMICK, JOHN W, 135 MIL-
DRED ST, CAMERON

ANCELET, PAMELA FAY,
171 ROSALIE LN, CAMERON 

ARCE, NOAH OMAR, 157
RIDGECREST RD, CAMERON

ARDOIN, RYAN JOSEPH,
117 FRANKLIN ST, CAMERON

AUCOIN, SHANNON K, 679
OAK GROVE HWY, CREOLE

AUGUSTA, ABRAHAM W,
413 FRUGE RD, SWEETLAKE

BABINEAUX, ROMONA
SMITH, 1601 HWY 384 #F,
GRAND LAKE

BADON, KENNETH E, 2431
GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

BADON, MISTY
MICHELLE, 115 EDDIE LN,
JOHNSON BAYOU

BALL, MELISSA RENEE,
5621 GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

BARGEMAN, ROSA L, 2761
TROSCLAIR RD, CREOLE

BARNETT, BILLY C, 1480 E
CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

BELL JR, JAMES A, 901 E
CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

BELLARD, LAWRENCE
JASON, 1025 OAK LN, HACK-
BERRY

BENOIT, HOPE M, 138 JOE
RUTHERFORD RD #A, CRE-
OLE

BENOIT, MICHAEL W, 479
OLD TOWN RD, HACKBERRY

BENSON, RUSTY S, 116
NORMAN LN, CREOLE

BERGERON, VIOLET VIC-
TORIA, 143 LONG ACRE DR,
GRAND LAKE

BILLIOT, HELEN L, 796
BENJAMIN LN, HACKBERRY

BOONE, AMANDA
MICHELLE, 165 MOTT RD,
SWEETLAKE

BOREL, JESSICA MARIE,
121 W MAIN ST, HACKBERRY

BORNE, JOYCE G, 124
NORRIS MHIRE RD, GRAND
CHENIER

BOUDOIN, DARRELL, 125
CAMILLE LN, CREOLE

BOUDOIN, GAYLE
GRANGER, 215 IDA LN,
GRAND LAKE

BOUDREAUX SR, ALFRED
P, 106 CARL MCCALL RD,
GRAND CHENIER

BOUDREAUX, BONNIE E,
650 LAKE BREEZE RD, HACK-
BERRY

BOUDREAUX, ELAINE V,
200 CARL MCCALL RD, GRAND
CHENIER

BOUDREAUX, JOSEPH
NEIL, 1054 E CREOLE HWY,
CREOLE

BRACKEEN, RITA H, 2526
TEAL ST, HOLLY BEACH

BREAUX, JOSHUA J, 612
VETERANS MEMORIAL DR,
KLONDIKE

BROUSSARD, KATRINA L,
1201 MARSHALL ST,
CAMERON

BROWN, JOHNNY, 1593
MARSHALL ST #19, CAMERON

BROWN, SHERRON A, 2236
A HERON ST, HOLLY BEACH

BURDEN, JOHN E, 1151
OAK GROVE HWY, CREOLE

BURKE, MARK ALLEN, 126
SHANNON LN. CREOLE

BURLEIGH, JENNY, 196
LONG ACRE DR, GRAND LAKE

BURROUGHS, JAMES E,
105 ELIZABETH ST, CAMERON

BURTON, ERIC D, 241
PETE SEAY CIR, HACKBERRY

BUSBY, ANDREW DER-
RICK, 353 GULFWAY DR,
HACKBERRY

BUSBY, CAROLYN ANN,
353 GULFWAY DR, HACKBER-
RY

CAIN, LARRY W, 272 PETE
SEAY CIR, HACKBERRY

CAPPS, ROBIN ANGELA,
124 EARL RD, CAMERON

CAROUTHERS, PHYLLIS B,
114 EDDIE LN, JOHNSON
BAYOU

CARPENTER, JEFFERY
LYNN, 2687 GRAND CHENIER
HWY, GRAND CHENIER

CARTER, LAWRENCE, 115
LEBLANC RD, CREOLE

CAUDILL, BONNIE L, 204
TARPON AVE, HOLLY BEACH

CHUGG, SIMON L, 413
FRUGE RD, SWEETLAKE

CLARK, KENNETH R, 373
MARSHALL ST, CAMERON

CLARK, PAUL BENJAMIN,
298 RIDGECREST RD,
CAMERON

CLEMENT, SUSAN BEG-
NAUD, 3311 TROSCLAIR RD,
CREOLE

CLINE, CARL L, 156 PAUL
RD, GRAND LAKE

COGAR, JARED PAUL, 4291
GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

CONNER, BRANDON C,
1790 E CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

CONNER, JESSYE R, 174
ADAM ROUX ST, CAMERON

CONNER, MICHELLE T,
227 MCCALL ST, GRAND CHE-
NIER

COULSTON, DOROTHY B,
319 BANK ST, BIG LAKE

COZART, EVA LANE, 142-H
LOUISE ST, CAMERON

CROSS, SONYA RENEE,
144-Q OLIVE T/P RD, CREOLE

DAIGLE, KEVIN JAMES,
3511 TROSCLAIR RD, CREOLE

DALE, JOSEPH EDWARD,
126 SHANNON LN, CREOLE

DANIELS, CARLOS R, 5750
W CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

DARNEAL, DANNY
WAYNE, 115 VELMA ST, JOHN-
SON BAYOU

DAVIS, DANIEL MARK, 283
LAKE BREEZE RD, HACKBER-
RY

DAVIS, LISA MARIE, 110
MEYERS RD, HACKBERRY

DEAN, BEAULA RICHARD,
259 PETE SEAY CIR, HACK-
BERRY

DELAFOSE, JOSEPHINE,
413 FRUGE RD, SWEETLAKE

DEMARY, RANDALL
VINCE, 160 MALLARD LN,
GRAND LAKE

DEVALL, ALFRED, 124
DEVALL RD, HACKBERRY

DEVALL, BRANDON J, 126
DEVALL RD, HACKBERRY

DEVALL, JAMES R, 126
DEVALL RD, HACKBERRY

DEVALL, LANA R, 126
DEVALL RD, HACKBERRY

DIBBLE, JAMES V, 119 BIG
LAKE ST, BIG LAKE

DIBBLE, JULIE M, 119 BIG
LAKE ST, BIG LAKE

DOMINGUE, HAROLD J,

549 MERMENTAU RIVER RD,
GRAND CHENIER

DOMINGUE, WILLARD
RAY, 527 MERMENTAU RIVER
RD, GRAND CHENIER

DOUCET JR, ALBERT, 2335
TROSCLAIR RD, CREOLE

DOUCET, ANDRE ELIZA-
BETH, 134 BEAU CLOS RD,
GRAND LAKE

DROUNETT, MRS LILLIAN
S, 127 DROUNETT LN, HACK-
BERRY

DRUMMOND, JENNIFER,
184 LONG ACRE DR, GRAND
LAKE

DUDDLESTON, SHELLY D,
3593 GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

DUFRENE, BRADLEY
JASON, 104 MALLARD LN,
GRAND LAKE

DUHON, BEAU ANTHONY,
110 VICTORIA LN, CREOLE

DUHON, DOLLY J, 142
ALVIN RD, CREOLE

DUNLAP, TINA ELIZA-
BETH, 757 BENJAMIN LN,
HACKBERRY

DUPKE, KEVIN CHARLES,
205 CAMERON DR, CREOLE

DURAND, LESIA PRINCE,
1292 HWY 384, GRAND LAKE

DYSON, BRENDA KAY, 155
SCHOOL ST #B, CAMERON

DYSON, LYDIA G, 147
JOHN ST, CAMERON

DYSON, WINONA C, 223
INDIAN POINT, GRAND CHE-
NIER

EAST, MICHELLE L, 334
CHANNELVIEW DR, HACK-
BERRY

FALCON, STEPHANIE
LELIA, 355 MERMENTAU
RIVER RD, GRAND CHENIER

FAWVOR, MRS JOSEPHINE
B, 449 MERMENTAU RIVER
RD, GRAND CHENIER

FAWVOR, SHAUN JOSEPH,
3739 GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

FERGUSON, RAYNA C,
11269 HWY 384, BIG LAKE

FITKIN, LORI M, 150 TEAL
LN, SWEETLAKE

FONTENOT, THOMAS
JOSEPH, 1927 OAK GROVE
HWY, GRAND CHENIER

FORD, KEVIN DEWAYNE,
3531 TROSCLAIR RD, CREOLE

FOUDRAY, ELIZABETH
ANN, 2427 MALLARD ST,
HOLLY BEACH

FREEZE, ERMA B, 224
BOURG RD, CAMERON

GALLEGOS, BRANDON
LEE, 196 GALLEGOS LN,
HACKBERRY

GALLEGOS, RICKY J, 199
GALLEGOS LN, HACKBERRY

GARDNER, FRANK E, 156
LILLIAN ST, CAMERON

GASPARD, DOROTHY T,
306 RICHARD LN, JOHNSON
BAYOU

GIFFORD, RONALD
DEWAYNE, 221 BOUDREAUX
LN, GRAND LAKE

GIFFORD, SHARRON MOR-
RIS, 221 BOUDREAUX LN,
GRAND LAKE

GIRLINGHOUSE, SHIRLEY
RENEA, 885 HWY 384, GRAND
LAKE

GRAHAM, SAMANTHA
NICHOLE, 107 NUNEZ RD,
CREOLE

GROSS, JODY F, 126 ALVIN
GUIDRY CIR, HACKBERRY

GUIDRY, BRIAN J, 798
BENJAMIN LN, HACKBERRY

GUIDRY, JOHN A, 164
ALTON LN, CREOLE

GUILLORY, CHASIDY
DELORIS, 130 HAYES PICOU
RD #C, CAMERON

GUILLORY, HORACE HILL,
322 CHANNELVIEW DR,
HACKBERRY

HAISLIP, JASON K, 223
INDIAN POINT, GRAND CHE-
NIER

HAMPTON, DAMON
LEIGH, 175 HOPE ST,
CAMERON

HANSEN, PATRICE
RENEE, 120 CRAIG LN, CRE-
OLE

HARDEE, EVELYN H., 119
MALLARD LN, GRAND LAKE

HARRIS, AMANDA N, 106
LEONCE NUNEZ LN, CREOLE

HARRISON, ALMA REGEL-
MAN, 317 BIG LAKE ST, BIG
LAKE

HARRISON, CLYDE
ARTHUR, 317 BIG LAKE ST,
BIG LAKE

HAYWOOD JR, WESLEY J,
139 SCHOOL ST #7, CAMERON

HEBERT, CHRISTOPHER
D, 440 EVERETT VINCENT DR,
HACKBERRY

HEBERT, JIMMIE L, 236
LILLIAN ST, CAMERON

HEBERT, NATHAN
MICHAEL, 121 A J LN, HACK-
BERRY

HENDRIX, TABITHA
MICHELLE, 190 MURPHY LN,
CREOLE

HENRY, EDWIN S, 931
MARSHALL ST, CAMERON

HENRY, LISA B, 931 MAR-
SHALL ST, CAMERON

HOFFPAUER, CLARK, 3371
GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

HOFFPAUER, DEBORAH
M, 3371 GRAND CHENIER
HWY, GRAND CHENIER

HOLLAND, WILWAYCO, 185
BIG PASTURE RD, BIG LAKE

HONEYCUTT, JEREMY
SLADE, 104 ELAINE LN,
GRAND LAKE

HUFFMAN, TONI LYN, 113
OLIVE LN, GRAND CHENIER

JACKSON, VELVA Z, 5282
GULF BEACH HWY, JOHNSON
BAYOU

JAMES, KEVIN PAUL, 139
TEAL LN, SWEETLAKE

JANUARY, LAURA M, 151
GRAND CHENIER HWY #H,
GRAND CHENIER

JEFFERSON, STACY ANN,
188 MCCALL ST, GRAND CHE-
NIER

JINKS, JOSEPH LYNN, 365
ISAAC LN, JOHNSON BAYOU

JOHNSON, AMMIE JOI, 254
CHANNELVIEW DR #8, HACK-
BERRY

JOHNSON, DARLENE B,
126 EDNA RD, GRAND LAKE

JOHNSON SR, JOSEPH
EDWARD, 123 EDNA RD,
GRAND LAKE

JOHNSON, KENNETH O,
200 ALLADIN RD, HACKBERRY

JONES, DAWN SCARLAT-
TA, 1593 MARSHALL ST #37,
CAMERON

JONES, WALTER C, 697
MARSHALL ST, CAMERON

1. PW 533 Cameron Parish
School Board Administration
Building - approved Change of
Location (Bid advertising sched-
ule to begin April 24, 2008)

2. PW 2397 South Cameron
High School - Approved Change
of Location, Consolidation,
Identified as Improved Project
(Bid advertising scheduled to
begin May 29, 2008)

Received and approved
monthly update on FEMA issues -
with overall payments of
$5,061,122.35 to date, per spread
sheet as presented by the
Superintendent

Board approved the Policy
DFL Cash Management as pre-
sented by the Superintendent
(ATTACHMENT #3)

On the motion of Mr. Nunez,
seconded by Mrs. Trahan, the
Board received and approved the
2008 Cameron Parish
Graduation Dates as presented
by the Superintendent. The dates
are as follows:

Grand Lake High School,
Friday, May 23, 2008 7:00 pm
Rosa Hart Theatre

Hackberry High School,
Friday, May 23, 2008 7:00 pm
Hackberry High School Gym

Johnson Bayou High School,
Saturday, May 24, 2008 7:00 pm
Johnson Bayou High School Gym

South Cameron High School,
Saturday, May 24, 2008 - 10:00
am South Cameron High School
Gym

On the motion of Mrs. Nunez,
seconded by Mr. McEvers, the
Board received the report on
“Cameron Can” Environmental
Awareness projects as district-
wide academic and extra curricu-
lar focus for 2008-2009 school
year with Connie Dore’s annual
art and slogan/essay contest as
Spring Kickoff as presented by
the Superintendent.

On the motion of Mrs.
Trahan, seconded by Mrs. Nunez,
the Board approved the contract
with Siemens Building
Technologies, Inc., as presented
by Superintendent and Mr.
Robert Mott

Johnson Bayou High School
and Grand Lake High School (ele-
mentary building) - all new
equipment with recent construc-
tion

Hackberry High School and
Grand Lake High School retrofit-
ted at time of original contract,
recently updated

South Cameron High School
temporary buildings - N/A

South Cameron High School
and Central Office - addressed in
project design

The cost of the annual con-
tract for the services listed above
is $16,740 for the period covering
December 1, 2007 through
November 30, 2008.

On the motion of Mr.
McEvers, seconded by Mrs.
Trahan, the Board received a
report on an updated dental plan
to employee Section 125 benefit
package (cafeteria plan), and
receive update on 403(b) and
457(b) compliance as presented
by James Odom, Jr., First
Financial Group of America. The
Board as the staff to conduct a
survey with employees regarding
the cost and benefits provided
and
with make a decision at a later
board meeting.

On the motion of Mr. Nunez,
seconded by Mrs. Theriot, the
Board approved the Manti
Operating Company, Right of
Way across School Board proper-
ty to drill site on Sections 22, 23
and 27 T12S-R5W and install a
flow line parallel to existing road,
3 year term, to continue as long
as production is obtained,
$20,000 consideration, $1,000 per
year for access rights, $10,000
per producing well. If no wells are
produced; then the right of way
payment would be increased to
$5,000 per year. (Attachment #4)

On the motion of Mr.
McEvers, seconded by Mrs.
Nunez, the Board approved the
request on Section 16-12-10
(Black Lake-Hackberry), Dept. of
Natural Resource, Coastal
Reference Monitoring System
(CRMS), Right of Way, 20 years to
Set up a CRMS site. (Attachment
#5)

On the motion of Mr. Nunez,
seconded by Mrs. Theriot, the
Board tabled the motion on
Section 16-12-10 (Black Lake-
Hackberry), as presented by Mr.
Channing Hayden of the Lake
Charles Harbor & Terminal
District, for a Right of Way and
lay a temporary pipeline to bring
dredge material from the
Calcasieu River to the marsh cre-
ation site by September 30, 2009
or completion of the project
whichever comes first.

On the motion of Mrs.
Theriot, seconded by Mrs.
Trahan, the Board approved the
purchase of property adjacent to
Johnson Bayou High School at
price of $281,576.00 ($20,000 per
acre for about 14 acres) as negoti-
ated by District Attorney Cecil
Sanner and price approved by
Little and Associates, auditors for
Cameron Parish School Board,
with funding through Cheniere
Energy’s prepayment of taxes as
presented by District Attorney
Cecil Sanner.

On the motion of Mr. Nunez,
seconded by Mrs. Theriot, the
Board approved the out-of state
travel requests as listed and pre-
sented by the Superintendent.

1. Grand Lake School -
Eighth grade - Bobbye Delaney -
approximately 30 students - 8th
grade end-of-year trip, SeaWorld
San Antonio, The Alamo, and
Riverwalk, San Antonio, Texas.
Leaving 12:30 P.M. Thursday
May 8, 2008 returning 11:00 P.M.
Saturday May 10, 2008 on
Charter bus: Skipper
Transportation.

2. Grand Lake School - Art
Club & Science Club - Susan
Arnold & Bobbye Delaney -
approximately 40 students -
Museum of Natural Science,
Museum of Fine Arts, IMAX
Theatre, ice skating, Museum of
Contemporary Art, and area gal-

$92,357.93
16TH SECTION, $

9,882,129.68
GENERAL FUND,

$21,026,000.57
SPECIAL PROJECTS,

$1,291,112.70
PROTEST TAX,

$3,411,808.20
DISTRICT #10 TAX,

$265,000.00
TOTAL, $37,291,447.90
INVESTMENT TYPE, % OF

TOTAL
TOTAL LAMP INVEST-

MENTS, 17%
TOTAL CD INVESTMENTS,

48%
TOTAL BOND INVEST-

MENTS, 33%
TOTAL UBS INVESTMENT,

2%
100%
RESOLUTION OF

CAMERON PARISH SCHOOL
BOARD REGARDING EMPLOY-
MENT OF SPECIAL COUNSEL

WHEREAS, Louisiana
Revised Statutes 42:263 autho-
rizes the retention of special
counsel by any school board upon
a statement of reasons why such
counsel is necessary and upon the
approval by the Attorney
General; and

WHEREAS, the Cameron
Parish School Board has
employed the law firm
Hammonds & Sills since 2002 as
its special counsel with experi-
ence, training, and expertise in
school law issues including, but
not limited to, special education,
school personnel matters, public
bid law and general school board
policy matters involving compli-
ance with the federal and state
laws and regulations, including
due process hearings, tenure
hearings, misconduct investiga-
tions and the handling of admin-
istrative hearings and litigation
in state and federal courts; and

WHEREAS, through its rep-
resentation of the Cameron
Parish School Board and various
school boards throughout the
State of Louisiana, the law firm
of Hammonds & Sills of Baton
Rouge and Monroe, Louisiana,
has special experience, training
and expertise in those issues of
school law.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT
DULY RESOLVED by the
Cameron Parish School Board in
regular session duly convened:

Section I - This School Board
does hereby renew its employ-
ment of the law firm of
Hammonds & Sills of Baton
Rouge and Monroe, Louisiana as
special counsel with training,
experience and expertise in
school law issues including, but
not limited to, special education,
school personnel matters, public
bid law and general policy mat-
ters to include administrative
hearings and litigation with
respect thereto for the purpose of
advising, consulting with, and
representing this School Board in
connection with such legal mat-
ters involving the school system.

Section II - Said law firm
shall be paid for their services at
hourly rates equal to the
class=Section2>
maximum hourly fee schedule for
special counsel published by the
Attorney General of the State of
Louisiana in effect at the time of
the services subject to a maxi-
mum hourly rate of $150.00 and
except that the paralegal rate
shall be $75.00 per hour and to be
reimbursed for out-of-pocket
expenses for long distance tele-
phone calls, document duplica-
tion, expert witness fees, court
reporter fees, printing costs, trav-
el expenses and other expenses as
a result of the legal services to
and for this School Board..

Section III - Said law firm
shall keep itemized time records
for presentation to the
Superintendent with respect to
services rendered at said hourly
rates and the expenses incurred,
and the Superintendent is hereby
authorized and directed to pay
same upon submission and
receipt thereof.

Section IV - This employment
shall continue and is effective
immediately upon adoption of
this resolution.

The vote, in open meeting, on
the resolution was as follows:

YEAS: Mr. Dwayne Sanner,
Mr. R. Scott Nunez, Mr. Loston
McEvers, Mrs. Karen Nunez,
Mrs. Dot Theriot, Mrs. Marsha
Trahan

NAYS: None
ABSENT: Mr. Marvin Trahan

CERTIFICATE
I hereby certify that the fore-

going Resolution was adopted by
the Ascension Parish School
Board in regular session duly
convened on April 14, 2008 and
that same has not been rescinded
or repealed.

CAMERON, LOUISIANA,
this 14th day of April, 2008.

Mr. Dwayne Sanner, President 
CAMERON PARISH 

SCHOOL BOARD
Ms. Stephanie Rodrigue,
Secretary-Treasurer
CAMERON PARISH 
SCHOOL BOARD
RUN: May 29 (M 52)

PUBLIC NOTICE 
INACTIVE VOTERS LIST
PARISH OF CAMERON
In accordance with

R.S.18:193 F, the following is a
list of all voters in the inactive
file in the Cameron Parish
Registrar of Voters’ Office.

If a voters’ name appears on
the list, it is an indication that
the Registrar of Voters has rea-
son to believe that the person has
changed his or her address or
that their address on file in the
Registrar’s office is incomplete.

If the voters listed in this
publication fail to correct or con-
firm their address by November
4, 2008, their names could be
removed from the voting roll.

***
ABSHIRE JR, LEO P, 2438

TEAL ST, HOLLY BEACH
ACHESON, MARK

WILLIAM 1569-D, LIT-
TLE CHENIER RD, CREOLE

AGUILLARD, CARL
ANTHONY, 3157 TROSCLAIR
RD, CREOLE

AKERS, JUDITH MARIE,
455 LAKE BREEZE RD., HACK-
BERRY

AKERS, THEODORE
WAYNE, 455 LAKE BREEZE
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6:30 A.M. Friday April 25, 2008
returning 6:00 P.M. Saturday
April 26, 2008 on parish own
school bus with regular route dri-
ver.

3. South Cameron School -
Fourth grade - Courtnie King,
Peggy Griffith, Amy Pearce -
approximately 39 students -
Moody Gardens, Galveston
Texas. Leaving 7:00 A.M.
Thursday May 1, 2008 returning
6:30 P.M. same day on parish
owned activity bus with certified
driver.

4. South Cameron School -
Fifth grade - Melisa Bonsall -
approximately 19 students -
Museum of Natural Science,
Houston Texas. Leaving 6:00
A.M. Thursday April 17, 2008
returning 6:30 P.M. same day on
parish owned route bus with cer-
tified driver.

5. South Cameron School -
Seventh grade - Rachel Demeritt
- approximately 31 students -
Moody Gardens, Galveston
Texas. Leaving 7:00 A.M.
Thursday May 8, 2008, returning
6:30 P.M. same day on parish
owned route bus with certified
route driver.

6. Johnson Bayou School -
First, Fourth, & Fifth grades -
Leslie Landry, Alaina
Schexneider, & Melissa Guidry -
Approximately 27 students -
Moody Gardens, Galveston
Texas. Leaving at 7:00 A.M.
Thursday May 1, 2008 returning
6:00 P.M. the same day on parish
owned route bus with certified
bus driver. 

On the motion of Mrs. Nunez,
seconded by Mrs. Trahan, the
Board approved the of resolution,
per RS 42:263, to formally
employee Hammonds and Sills,
Attorneys at Law, as special
counsel to Cameron Parish
School Board at hourly rate of
$150.00 per attorney and $75.00
per paralegal, as presented by the
Superintendent.

On the motion of Mrs. Nunez,
seconded by Mrs. Theriot, the
Board approved the Personnel
Report as follows:

Personnel Recommendations:
The following personnel items are
recommended by the
Superintendent Stephanie D.
Rodrigue, Superintendent Date
4-14-2008. 

Personnel Report
Payment of 25 Unpaid Sick

Leave Days:
Sandra Smith Grand Lake

High School, Elementary Teacher
RESIGNATION

Ronald Aplin Grand Lake
High School, Spanish Interpreter,
effective March 17, 2008
RESIGNATION WITH PERMIS-
SION TO ADVERTISE

Keith Portie Hackberry High
School, Sweeper
PERMISSION TO ADVERTISE
WITHIN DISTRICT ONLY;
THEN ADVERTISE FOR OPEN-
INGS INCURRED

Reading Coaches, PreK-4
with other applicable duties To
meet requirements of Louisiana
Department of Education’s
“Ensuring Literacy for All
Initiative” (all 4 sites have grant
applications on file; other funding
sources will be applied)
PERMISSION TO ADVERTISE

Project Manager (Architect,
Engineer or Project Management
Institute Certified Project
Manager)

To supervise construction
projects (FEMA projects funded
through Project Management
monies specific to PW’s; others
through FEMA Administration;
local projects through local funds)

Necessary School Staff
Following transfer options within
district

On the motion of Mrs. Nunez,
seconded by Mr. Nunez, the
Board approved entering into
Executive Session for the follow-
ing purposes:

Student Discipline Appeal -
Superintendent, District
Attorney Cecil Sanner, School
Principal, Eddie Benoit

Ongoing litigation issues
with property insurance compa-
nies and Army Corps of
Engineers - Superintendent,
District Attorney Cecil Sanner

ROLL CALL VOTE to enter
into Executive Session:

YEAS: Mrs. Trahan, Mrs.
Theriot, Mr. Sanner, Mrs. Nunez,
Mr. McEvers and Mr. Nunez

NAYS: None
ABSENT: Mr. Trahan
On the motion of Mrs. Nunez,

seconded by Mrs. Trahan, the
Board approved re-entering into
the regular school board meeting.

ROLL CALL VOTE to enter
into Regular Session:

YEAS: Mrs. Trahan, Mrs.
Theriot, Mr. Sanner, Mrs. Nunez,
Mr. McEvers and Mr. Nunez

NAYS: None
ABSENT: Mr. Trahan
On the motion of Mr. Nunez,

seconded by Mrs. Nunez, the
Board received information
regarding Ongoing litigation
issues with property insurance
companies and Army Corps of
Engineers and upheld school dis-
trict decision on a student man-
agement issue. 

On the motion of Mrs.
Theriot, seconded by Mrs. Nunez,
the Board adjourned the regular
school meeting.

APPROVED:
Dwayne Sanner, President

CAMERON PARISH 
SCHOOL BOARD

ATTEST:
Stephanie D. Rodrigue,
Superintendent
CAMERON PARISH 
SCHOOL BOARD

ATTACHMENT #1
CAMERON PARISH 

SCHOOL BOARD
CASH REPORT AS

OF MARCH 31, 2008
MTD; YTD
Beginning Balance:

$826,927.00; $1,010,351.00
Cash Revenues:
Ad Valorem Taxes

$168,060.00; $ 9,249,387.00
Tuition from Other Sources $-

; $2,950.00
Bus Rentals $999.00;

$3,185.00
Interest on Investments

$62,654.00; $71,674.00
Royalties $138,457.00;

$1,062,021.00
Rentals $-; $1,200.00
Contributions and Donations

$-; $660,866.00 Cont. on Page 9.

LEGAL
NOTICES
Cont. from Page 7.



CREOLE
THIBODEAUX, JAMES

ROBERT, 160 DONNA RD,
GRAND LAKE

THIBODEAUX, SHANNON
RAY, 1569 LITTLE CHENIER
RD, CREOLE

THIBODEAUX, WILSON L,
719 LITTLE CHENIER RD,
CREOLE

THOMAS, GRACIE G, 322
CHANNELVIEW DR, HACK-
BERRY

THOMAS SR, ODELL, 322
CHANNELVIEW DR, HACK-
BERRY

THOMPSON, JERRY R, 233
RATCLIFF ST, CAMERON

THOMPSON, SUSIE MAY,
573 MARSHALL ST, CAMERON

THRUSTON, CHRISTO-
PHER LEON, 123 ABRAHAM
ST, CAMERON

TOUCHET, MRS LUCY S,
381 W MAIN ST, HACKBERRY

TRAHAN, BRIAN J, 184
FRANCIS CIR, CAMERON

TRAHAN, CHERYL ANN,
161 DAN ST, CAMERON

TRAHAN, DENNIS JAMES,
161 DAN ST, CAMERON

TRAHAN, JAMES B, 117
HARPER ST, CAMERON

TRAHAN, JUNE M, 3361
TROSCLAIR RD, CREOLE

TRAHAN, MARTIN L, 1903
OAK GROVE HWY, GRAND
CHENIER

TRAHAN, MRS PATTY J,
117 HARPER ST, CAMERON

TRAHAN, TIMOTHY W,
1749 LITTLE CHENIER RD,
CREOLE

TRIVIETS, KIMBERLY
RENEE, 125 TEAL LN, SWEET-
LAKE

TROTTER, LLOYD SHER-
MAN, 1593 MARSHALL ST #16,
CAMERON

VALLERY, KATHLEEN
DEFALCO, 143 JOE RUTHER-
FORD RD, CREOLE

VARGAS, ROSA CAMPOS,
142-A LOUISE ST, CAMERON

VARNES, GAYLYNN S, 150
MAIN ST #D, HACKBERRY

VAUGHN, BECKY RUTH,
139 ALVIN GUIDRY CIR, HACK-
BERRY

VAUGHN, TURLEY GRANT,
139 ALVIN GUIDRY CIR, HACK-
BERRY

VENABLE SR, CLYDE J, 154
LEGION RD, HACKBERRY

VENABLE, TERRI R, 104
COHEN LN, HACKBERRY

VEST, LARISSA GAIL, 722
BENJAMIN LN, HACKBERRY

VINCENT, BOBBY R, 4729
W CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

VINCENT, LYNN A, 3077
GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

VINCENT, PHILLIP C, 225
VINCENT RD, GRAND CHE-
NIER

VINCENT, TY KEEGAN, 980
OAK LN, HACKBERRY

WALKER, JOSHUA CAIN,
183 PIERRE ST, CAMERON

WARD, ANESSA ELAINE,
2112 EGRET ST, HOLLY BEACH

WARE, KAYLEE DIAN, 2506
MALLARD ST, HOLLY BEACH

WARE, RANDY KENT, 2506
MALLARD ST, HOLLY BEACH

WATTERS, KENNETH CAR-
RIGAN, 154 LEESBURG ST,
CAMERON

WEBB, GEORGIA DAIGLE,
111 ALVIN GUIDRY CIR, HACK-
BERRY

WELCH, MELISSA JANE,
291 CHANNELVIEW DR,
HACKBERRY

WELLS, RHONDA E, 179
LOUISE ST, CAMERON

WHITE, CYNTHIA A, 206
IDA LN, GRAND LAKE

WING, JOHN F, 145 WELCH
DR, HACKBERRY

WONSON JR, ROBERT, 165
B CHAD LN, CREOLE

WOOD, WHITNEY JOSEPH,
397 NORTH ISLAND RD,
GRAND CHENIER

WOODGETT, PAMELAANN,
1593 MARSHALL ST #37,
CAMERON

YOUNGBLOOD, JOHN
SCOTT, 1355 MUSTANG CIR,
HACKBERRY

YOUNGBLOOD, MARY
JEAN, 1355 MUSTANG CIR,
HACKBERRY

ZIRLOTT, GEORGE F, 225-A
CHANNEL DR, HACKBERRY

SUZANNE STURLESE, 
REGISTRAR OF VOTER,

CAMERON PARISH, 
122-F RECREATION 

CENTER LN.
337-775-5493

RUN: May 29 & June 5 (M 57)

NOTICE FOR BIDS
The Cameron Council on

Aging is soliciting bids for the
performance of their 2008 audit.
Persons interested in submitting
a bid of the work should contact
the Council on Aging at 951 Hwy
384, Lake Charles, La 70607 or
call 337-905-6000 to secure an
RFP packet. Explained in the
RFP are the details of the pro-
gram and deadlines. Work
records may be reviewed by
potential bidders on June 13,
2008 by appointments. The audit
proposal is due by July 11, 2008
at 951 Hwy 384, Grand Lake. The
final audit is due October 13,
2008. Contact Dinah Landry,
Executive Director or Lori
Broussard Assistant Director.
RUN: May 22 & 29 (M 59)

PROCEEDINGS
Vice-President, John Calzada

called the Cameron Parish Public
Library Board of Control meeting
to order on Monday, April 21 2008
at the Grand Lake Library at
3:00 p.m. The following members
were present: John Calzada,
Wanita Harrison, Gail
Delcambre, Dinah Billings and
Cyndi Sellers. Absent were:
Kenny Trahan and Magnus
McGee, Police Jury ex-officio
member.

Wanita Harrison led the
prayer and Gail Delcambre led
the Pledge of Allegiance.

On the motion of Mrs.
Harrison, seconded by Mrs.
Delcambre and carried the board
unanimously voted to amend and
add to the agenda the following
item: Meeting Time.

On the motion of Mrs.
Delcambre, seconded by Mrs.
Harrison and carried the board
unanimously voted to accept the
March 17, 2008 minutes.

Financial Report was
unavailable.

On the motion of Mr.
Calzada, seconded by Mrs.
Harrison and carried the board

KELLEY, ASHA J, 116 EARL
RD, CAMERON

KERSHAW, SONYA-KRIS-
TINE, 300 MAIN ST, HACKBER-
RY

KING, LAUREN ELICE
BOSWELL, 188 BORNE LN,
GRAND LAKE

KNAPP, FRANCINE C, 212
GULFWAY DR, HACKBERRY

KUHLTHAY, JOANIE RAE,
322 CHANNELVIEW DR,
HACKBERRY

LABOVE, BRENT ALLEN,
3131 TROSCLAIR RD, CREOLE

LACOMB, SABRINA D, 643
LITTLE CHENIER RD, CRE-
OLE

LALONE, VIRGINIA ROSE,
5621 GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

LANDRENEAUX, DARRYLL
L, 403 E CREOLE HWY, CRE-
OLE

LANDRENEAUX, KATRINA
LORRAINE, 251 JOHNNY
BENOIT RD, HACKBERRY

LANDRY, DORIS J, 128
DELTRA HARDIN RD, HACK-
BERRY

LANGLEY JR, JAMES
LARRY, 125 PHIRMA RD, CRE-
OLE

LAPOINT, BRADY ALLEN,
126 PINE ST, CAMERON

LASALLE, MARVIN, 104
LASALLE RD, CREOLE

LASALLE, SHIRLEY, 135
LASALLE RD, CAMERON

LEANNA, ROXANNA C,
1212 MARSHALL ST,
CAMERON

LEBLANC, DANIEL R, 5408
W CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

LEBLEU, FERRALL G, 192
SUPERIOR RD, HACKBERRY

LEE, SHANNON L, 144
OLIVE T/P RD #K, CREOLE

LEMIEUX, HEATH A, 6488
GULF BEACH HWY, JOHNSON
BAYOU

LEONARDS, EDITH
LAVELLE, 161 DEVALL RD,
HACKBERRY

LEONARDS JR, LUDWIG J,
161 DEVALL RD, HACKBERRY

LEWIS, JAMES BEN-
JAMIN, 4794 W CREOLE HWY,
CREOLE

LITTLE, LONNIE J, 251
GULFWAY DR, HACKBERRY

LONGWORTH JR, DANIEL
L, 113 DENNIS LN, HACKBER-
RY

LONGWORTH, DANIEL L,
113 DENNIS LN, HACKBERRY

MAGNON, DEANNA B, 105
TARPON AVE, HOLLY BEACH

MALLETT, DARRELL
WAYNE, 2206B LITTLE CHE-
NIER RD, CREOLE

MANNING, AMANDA FAYE,
130 DAIGLE RD, CREOLE

MARCANTEL, LARRIA
ANN, 786 E CREOLE HWY,
CREOLE

MARTIN, ROSS MICHAEL,
329 BIG LAKE ST, BIG LAKE

MATHESON, DONAS
CHRISTOPHER, 1379 OAK
GROVE HWY, GRAND CHE-
NIER

MATTHEWS, CHRISTO-
PHER K, 133 JINKS LN, JOHN-
SON BAYOU

MCCARTIN, DONALD, 136
D J LN, HACKBERRY

MCCAULEY, JO A V, 111
BAZILE DAIGLE RD, BIG LAKE

MCCHESNEY, THOMAS RY,
479 OLD TOWN RD, HACKBER-
RY

MCFARLAND, SAMANTHA
LYNN, 120 MAC ARTHUR ST,
CAMERON

MELVIN JR, RICHARD
LEE, 5986 W CREOLE HWY,
CREOLE

MENARD, ALVIA J, 1381
HORSESHOE LN, HACKBERRY

MHIRE, ALICIA DAWN, 142
HORSESHOE LN, GRAND
CHENIER

MHIRE, JANET L, 142
HORSESHOE LN, GRAND
CHENIER

MHIRE, KENNETH EVANS,
144 OLIVE T/P RD #G, CREOLE

MHIRE, KEVIN D, 4963
GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

MILLER, BEVERLY D, 628
MERMENTAU RIVER RD,
GRAND CHENIER

MILLER, MRS MARY L, 163
HENRY ST, CAMERON

MIXON, TIMOTHY DAVID,
114 LINDA ST, CAMERON

MOHON, JON JOSEPH, 304
JOHN TEE LN, JOHNSON
BAYOU

MORALES, ELMA L, 199
RUTHERFORD LN, GRAND
CHENIER

MORALES, RUBEN, 199
RUTHERFORD LN, GRAND
CHENIER

MORALES, TERRI MARIE,
325 OLD TOWN RD, HACKBER-
RY

MORRIS, PATRICIA A, 110
SCHOOL BOY RD, CAMERON

MOUTINHO, TROY
ANTHONY, 173 LOUISE ST,
CAMERON

MUDD, OLGA V, 6155 W
CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

MUDD, ROBERT E, 6155 W
CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

MURRAY, BRITTNE, 441
LAKE BREEZE RD, HACKBER-
RY

NEAL JR, ROBERT LOUIS,
700 MAIN ST, HACKBERRY

NEWMAN, DEWAYNE E,
168 SCHOOL ST, CAMERON

NUNEZ, BARBARA LANE,
105 MHIRES LN, SWEETLAKE

NUNEZ, DAVID GARRETT,
160 CHUNNY RD, GRAND
CHENIER

OLINGER, JAMES JOHN,
451 SMITH RIDGE RD, JOHN-
SON BAYOU

OROURKE, MARY ELLEN,
263C GAYLE ST, CAMERON

PARKER, TIMOTHY A, 329
GAYLE ST, CAMERON

PAYNE JR, JAMES C, 1365
MARSHALL ST, CAMERON

PAYNE, JAMES CROWLEY,
1365 MARSHALL ST,
CAMERON

PESHOFF, PATRICK RAY-
MOND, 106 FRANK BENOIT
RD, BIG LAKE

PICKETT, FRANK DAVID,
1593 MARSHALL ST #31,
CAMERON

PICOU, JEROME A, 287
GAYLE ST, CAMERON

POUSSON, CLIFFORD
JAMES, 209 RIVER RD, LOWRY

PRADIA, TRAVIS J, 354

State.
6. All bids must be accompa-

nied by bid security equal to five
percent (5%) of the sum of the
base bid and all alternates, and
must be in the form of a certified
check or cashier’s check drawn on
a bank insured by the FDIC, or a
Bid Bond Form contained in con-
tract documents, written by a
surety company licensed to do
business in Louisiana with a A.M.
Best Rating of “A” or better, coun-
tersigned by a person who is
under contract with the surety
company or bond insurer as a
licensed agent in this state and
who is residing in this state, and
that it is listed thereon as
approved for an amount equal to
or greater than the amount for
which it obligates itself in this
instrument, all in accordance
with LSA--R.S. 38:2218.

No Bid Bond indicating an
obligation of less than five per-
cent (5%) by any method is
acceptable.

7. The successful bidder shall
be required to furnish a
Performance and Payment Bond
written by a company licensed to
do business in Louisiana, in an
amount equal to 100% of the
Contract amount, written by a
surety company licensed to do
business in Louisiana with a A.M.
Best Rating of “A” or better, all in
accordance with LSA--R.S.
38:2219. The bond shall be coun-
tersigned by a person who is
under contract with the surety
company or bond issuer as an
insurance agent in this State,
and who is residing in this State.

8. Bids shall be accepted only
from contractors who are licensed
under LA--R.S. 37:2150-2163 for
the classification of Building
Construction. No bid may be
withdrawn for a period of forty-
five (45) days after receipt of bids,
except under the provisions of
LA--R.S. 38:2214.

9. The Owner reserves the
right to reject any and all bids for
the just cause. In accordance with
LA--R.S. 38:221(A)(1)(b), the pro-
visions and requirements of this
Section, those stated in the
advertisement for bids, and those
required on the Bid Form shall
not be considered as informalities
and shall not be waived by any
public entity.

10. The public shall incur no
obligation to the Contractor until
the Contract between the Owner
and the Contractor is fully exe-
cuted.

11. Official action on this bid
will be taken within forty five
(45) days by the Cameron Parish
School Board.

12. All bids must be plainly
marked on the outside of the
envelope:

BID FOR “South
Cameron High School”

Mr. Dwayne Sanner, President
Cameron Parish School Board

RUN: May 29, June 5 & 12 (M 67)

LEGAL NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given

that 21st Mortgage Corporation,
the secured party having a secu-
rity interest in a 2006 Franklin
Benchmark 80x16 mobile home
bearing serial number
ALFRG04612791 and belonging
to Inga A. Leatherwood has been
authorized by a Louisiana court
to, and will in fact, retake posses-
sion of the said mobile home and
dispose of same thereafter at pub-
lic or private sale in accordance
with La. R.S. 9:5361.1. For infor-
mation contact 620 Market Street
Suite 100, Knoxville, TN 37902,
800-955-0021.
RUN: May 20 (M 68)

NOTICE OF PUBLIC MEET-
ING

A public hearing will be held
as follows: 

DATE: June 2, 2008
TIME: 5:30 P.M.
PLACE OF MEETING:

Cameron Parish Courthouse
Courtroom 119 Courthouse
Square, Cameron, LA 70631

AGENDA
1. Call to Order
2. Pledge of Allegiance
3. Roll Call
4. Approval of Minutes
5. Additions to Agenda
6. Crime Lab Budget
7. Drilling and Pipeline

Permits:
a. Davis Petroleum Company -

Grand Chenier, Section 22, T13S,
R3W, (proposed propwash and
structures for drilling SW
Mallard Bay Prospect No. 2 Well),
Cameron Parish, LA. (080601)

b. Exxonmobil Production
Company - North Holly Beach,
Section 24, T14S, R11W, (pro-
posed drillsite and structures for
drilling J.W. Mecom No. C-1
Well), Cameron Parish, LA.
(080603)

c. Davis Petroleum Company -
Grand Chenier, Section 22, T13S,
R3W, (proposed propwash and
structures for drilling SW
Mallard Bay Prospect No. 3 Well),
Cameron Parish, LA. (080604)

d. Natural Gas Pipeline
Company of America, LLC -
Johnson Bayou, Sections 22 & 23,
T15S, R13W, (proposed short seg-
ments of pipelines that intercon-

nect to existing pipelines within
the Williams Facility), Cameron
Parish, LA. (080608)

e. Energy XXI Gulf Coast, Inc.
- Johnson Bayou, Section 44,
T15S, R13W, (proposed 6-inch
pipeline for producing Venus
Prospect), Cameron Parish, LA.
(080610)

f. Pel-Tex Oil Company, LLC -
Little Chenier Field, Section 20,
T14S, R5W, (proposed well loca-
tion to drill Mermentau Minerals
Land Co. Well No. 1), Cameron
Parish, LA. (080611) 

8. Other Permits:
a. Karl Duke Hebert -

Sweetlake, Section 14, T12S,
R8W, (proposed excavation of
pond to provide fill for future
homesite), Cameron Parish, LA.
(080602)

b. U.S. Fish and Wildlife
Service - Lacassine National
Wildlife Refuge, Sections 2, 3, &
11, T12S, R5W, (proposed to con-
struct hurricane protection
levee), Cameron Parish, LA.
(080605)

c. Pel-Tex Oil Company, LLC -
Northeast Creole, Sections 7 & 8,
T13S, R8W, (proposed terraces as
mitigation for P20071196),
Cameron Parish, LA. (080606)

d. Bill Ackal - Big Lake, (pro-
posed to build camp and boat slip
in Pelican Point Subdivision),
Cameron Parish, LA. (080607)

e. Steve Henning -
Grangerville, Sections 22 & 23,
T12S, R7W, (proposed debris
removal and clean existing boat
trails), Cameron Parish, LA.
(080609)

f. Legacy Resources Company,
LP - North Holly Beach, Sections
26 & 38, T14S, R11W, (proposed
mitigation), Cameron Parish, LA.
(080612)

g. Joseph W. Broussard -
Grand Chenier, Section 40, T15S,
R6W, (proposed maintenance of
existing dock and bulkhead),
Cameron Parish, LA. (080613)

h. Raymond E. Hicks -
Hackberry, Section 27, T12S,
R10W, (proposed excavation of
pond to elevate land), Cameron
Parish, LA. (080614)

i. Lawrence R. LeBeouf - Little
Chenier, Section 7, T14S, R6W,
(proposed to recap existing levee),
Cameron Parish, LA. (080615)

j. Ventum Mandalay, LP -
Grand Chenier, Section 17, T15S,
R3W, (proposed mitigation along
west bank of Superior Canal),
Cameron Parish, LA. (080616)

k. Lawrence LeBoeuf - Grand
Lake, Tans Road, Section 22,
T12S, R8W, (proposed excavation
of pond to provide fill for home-
site), Cameron Parish, LA.
(080617)

9. Appointments:
a. Mosquito Control - Ernest

Vincent, Raymond Thibeaux -
term expired - Karl Styron

b. Gravity Dist. #4 - Kevin
Boudreaux - resigned - Shane
Broussard

10. Acceptance of Bids:
a. Project #2007-21 - Jetty

Fishing Pier - Phase 1
b. Project #2007-34 - East

Cameron Maintenance Barn 
11. Advertise for Bids:
a. Holly Beach Fire Station
12. President Authority to

Sign:
a. Cooperative Endeavor

Agreement - Office of Community
Development - LTCRP

13. Resolution - LTCRP -
Authority for President to sign all
document related to CDBG

14. Adopt the millage rates for
the tax year 2008:

a. Cameron Fire Protection
District No. 1 Maintenance

b. Hackberry Fire Protection
District No. 1 Maintenance

c. Cameron Fire Protection
District No. 7 Maintenance

d. Cameron Fire Protection
District No. 9 Maintenance

e. Cameron Fire Protection
District No. 10 Maintenance

f. Cameron Fire Protection
District No. 14 Maintenance

g. Cameron Fire Protection
District No. 15 Maintenance

h. Cameron Fire Protection
District No. 16 Maintenance

i. Courthouse and Jail
Maintenance

j. Library Maintenance
k. Health Unit Maintenance
l. Parishwide Road Tax
m. Parishwide Tax
n. Parishwide Garbage
o. Cameron Fire Protection

District No. 16 Sinking
p. Cameron Fire Protection

District No. 7 Sinking
15. Acceptance of Bids:
a. Official Journal
b. Engineer - CDBG
16. Staff Report:
17. Adjournment

BONNIE W. CONNER,
SECRETARY

CAMERON PARISH 
POLICE JURY
P.O. BOX 1280

CAMERON, LA 70631
(337) 775-5718

In accordance with the
Americans with Disabilities Act,
if you need special assistance,
please contact Bonnie Conner at
(337) 775-5718, Ext#110, describ-
ing the assistance that is neces-
sary.
Run: May 29 (M 69)

unanimously voted to change the
meeting time to 3:00 p.m.

On the motion of Mr.
Calzada, seconded by Mrs.
Harrison and carried the board
unanimously voted to reaffirm
plans to rebuild the Grand
Chenier Library.

On the motion of Mr.
Calzada, seconded by Mrs.
Harrison and carried the board
unanimously voted to accept the
general design of the Grand
Chenier Library.

Denelle Wrightson,
Consultant gave a brief presenta-
tion of information she had previ-
ously gathered from the staff and
listened to concerns the board
members had regarding the
Cameron Main Library.

On the motion of Mrs.
Delcambre, seconded by Mrs.
Billings and carried the board
authorized Mrs. Wrightson to
write a preliminary program for
the Cameron Main Library from
the information she gathered
from staff and board members.

The next meeting was set for
May 19, 2008 at 3:00 p.m.

There being no further busi-
ness and upon motion of Mr.
Calzada and seconded by Mrs.
Billings the meeting was
adjourned.

APPROVED:
/s/ Cyndi Sellers

Cyndi Sellers,
Board President

ATTEST:
/s/ Charlotte Trosclair
Charlotte Trosclair,
Secretary
RUN: May 29 (M 62)

PUBLIC NOTICE
The Cameron Parish Sheriff

has adopted his 2008-2009 oper-
ating budget. The budget docu-
ment is available for public
inspection in the business office
of the Sheriff, Parish Courthouse,
Cameron, Louisiana during regu-
lar office hours Monday through
Friday, (8:00 - 4:00).

/s/ Theos Duhon 
Theos Duhon, Sheriff

PARISH OF CAMERON
RUN: May 29 (M 65)

PROCEEDINGS
CAMERON PARISH WATER

AND WASTEWATER 
DISTRICT NO. 1

April 24, 2008
The Cameron Parish Water

and Wastewater District No. 1
Board met in regular session on
Thursday April 24, 2008 at 6:00
p.m. in the water district office
located at 126 Ann Street in the
town of Cameron, Louisiana.

Members present were: J. C.
Murphy, Bobby Doxey, James
Boudreaux, Tammy Peshoff, Paul
Duhon, Tony Porche.

Absent: Angie Brown
President J. C. Murphy called

the meeting to order.
On a motion by Tammy

Peshoff, seconded by Bobby
Doxey and carried to add Francis
Guilbeau to the agenda.

On a motion by Bobby Doxey,
seconded by James Boudreaux
and carried to approve and dis-
pense from reading of the March
minutes.

On a motion by Tony Porche,
seconded by Tammy Peshoff and
carried to approve the financial
statement.

On a motion by James
Boudreaux, seconded by Tony
Porche and carried that the bills
for the month be paid.

On a motion by Bobby Doxey,
seconded by Paul Duhon and car-
ried to accept bids on chlorine
and phosphates from C. & L.
Aqua Professionals.

On a motion by Tony Porche,
seconded by James Boudreaux
and carried to table adopt millage
rates till more information is
available on reappraisement.

On a motion by Paul Duhon,
seconded by Tony Porche and car-
ried to change trailer park usage
rate from $2.50 to $3.00 per 1000
gallons of water.

On a motion by Tony Porche,
seconded by Paul Duhon and car-
ried there being no further busi-
ness the meeting stand
adjourned.

/s/ J. C. Murphy
J. C. Murphy, President

Cameron Parish Water &
Wastewater District #1

/s/ Kathryn Guilbeau
Kathryn Guilbeau,
Secretary
RUN: May 29 (M 66)

ADVERTISEMENT
The Cameron Parish School

Board does hereby advertise for
sealed bids and will receive same
on:

1. Tuesday, July 8, 2008.
2. At the Offices of H. Curtis

Vincent - Steven D. Shows,
Architects, 1502 South
Huntington Street, Sulphur,
Louisiana 70663, until the hour
of 2:00 p.m. local time.

3. For Project: “South
Cameron High School”.

4. Contract documents,
including drawings, are on file at
the Offices of H. Curtis Vincent -
Steven D. Shows, Architects,
1502 South Huntington Street,
Sulphur, Louisiana 70663.
Complete documents may be
obtained from this office upon
deposit of $250.00 for each set of
documents. Deposit is fully
refundable for the first set of doc-
uments to all bonafide prime*
bidders upon return of the docu-
ments in good condition no later
than ten (10) days after receipt of
bids. The deposit of all other set
of documents will be refunded
fifty percent (50%) upon return of
documents as stated above. All
bids shall be submitted on
ENCLOSED BID FORMS OR
EXACT PHOTOCOPIES.

*Prime bidder is defined as
licensed General Contractors bid-
ding this job as such.

5. A Pre-Bid Conference will
be conducted at the project site on
Friday, June 20, 2008 at the hour
of 10:00 a.m. at the Project Site at
753 Oak Grove Hwy. Grand
Chenier, LA 70643. All interested
Bidders intending to submit bids
on this project are requested to
have a representative present at
this conference.

6. Preference is given to
materials, supplies, and provi-
sions that are produced, manu-
factured, or grown in Louisiana,
quality being equal to articles
offered by competitors outside the
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PRIMEAUX JR, GARRY

JOSEPH, 769 LITTLE CHE-
NIER RD, CREOLE

PRIMEAUX, PETRUS S, 131
CAMILLE LN, CREOLE

PUGH, RAIN SCOTT, 119
LINDA ST, CAMERON

RACE, DAVID L, 232
RICHARD LN, JOHNSON
BAYOU

RAFFIELD, JESSE D, 141
WELCH DR, HACKBERRY

RAFFIELD, PAMELA M, 231
CHANNELVIEW DR, HACK-
BERRY

RAMEY, TERRY LEE, 155
LONG ACRE DR, GRAND LAKE

RICHARD, CHRISTOPHER
A, 107 JOHN ST, CAMERON

RICHARD, COURTNEE
ANN, 122 SMITH LN, GRAND
LAKE

RICHARD, CURTIS P, 3641
GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

RICHARD JR, EDMOND
LEE, 236 T T MHIRE RD,
GRAND CHENIER

RICHARD, JESSICA T, 107
JOHN ST, CAMERON

RICHARD, KELLEY D, 2989
GRAND CHENIER HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

RICHARD, MELISSA
BYCHURCH, 140 JOE
RUTHERFORD RD, CREOLE

RICHARD, STEPHANIE,
261 E MILLER RD, GRAND
CHENIER

RICHARDSON, CHARLIE R,
104 ABRAHAM ST, CAMERON

ROBERTSON, BEAU JEF-
FREY, 421 W PRECHT RD,
SWEETLAKE

ROBINSON, DAWN
LOUISE, 1593 MARSHALL ST
#38, CAMERON

ROBINSON, REBECCA L,
106 LEONCE NUNEZ LN, CRE-
OLE

RODRIGUE, LACEY D’LYN,
7100 GULF BEACH HWY,
HOLLY BEACH

ROUGEAU, NIRA F, 112
SYCAMORE ST, CAMERON

ROUGEAU, TIFFANY S, 112
SYCAMORE ST, CAMERON

RUTHERFORD, KEVIN J,
145 RUTHERFORD LN, GRAND
CHENIER

RYAN, MEREDITH ANN,
1601 HWY 384 #E, GRAND
LAKE

RYDER, DENNIS W, 313
BIG LAKE ST, BIG LAKE

SAVOIE, KELLY T, 5800 W
CREOLE HWY, CREOLE

SCHERER, CLINTON E, 132
VEJAY ST, CAMERON

SCHEXNIDER, NORRIS G,
1345 HORSESHOE LN, HACK-
BERRY

SCHEXNIDER, RANDY M,
1310 SCHOOL ST, HACKBERRY

SCRIVNER, ANNE
KATHERINE, 335 LONG
BEACH RD, JOHNSON BAYOU

SELLERS, JEREMY PAUL,
1212 MARSHALL ST,
CAMERON

SHELTON, WILLIAM E, 113
HENRY ST, CAMERON

SHILOW, ELWANDER L,
1593 MARSHALL ST #33,
CAMERON

SHULL, CARL, 108 DELTRA
HARDIN RD, HACKBERRY

SHULL, DOROTHY W, 108
DELTRA HARDIN RD, HACK-
BERRY

SIKICH, STEVE M, 221 BIG
LAKE ST, BIG LAKE

SILVER, JULIE ANN, 151
AMOCO RD, HACKBERRY

SILVER, RANDY L, 162
LOREE LN, HACKBERRY

SIMMONS, SHANNON
JAMES, 140 JOSEPHINE RD,
BIG LAKE

SMITH, MRS EMMA, 162
ADAM ROUX ST, CAMERON

SMITH III, JAMES R, 144
OLIVE T/P RD, CREOLE

SMITH, JULIE C, 207
HEBERT T/P RD #C, GRAND
LAKE

SMITH, RODNEY L, 162
ADAM ROUX ST, CAMERON

SMITH, TANNER COLE,
1903 OAK GROVE HWY,
GRAND CHENIER

SMITHERS, DAVID P, 138E
JOE RUTHERFORD RD, CRE-
OLE

SMITHERS, JERRY E, 138E
JOE RUTHERFORD RD, CRE-
OLE

SONNIER, LOUIS R, 113
KERSHAW LN, CREOLE

SPRIGGS, KEVIN M, 1593
MARSHALL ST #26, CAMERON

STALEY, JASON C, 525
HWY 27, SWEETLAKE

STALEY, SHANNA
HEWLETT, 166 LEBOEUF RD,
SWEETLAKE

STOUTE, JAMES K, 160
FRANKLIN ST, CAMERON

STOUTE, KATHLEEN D,
124 ROGERS LN, CAMERON

STOUTE JR, LOUIE, 124
ROGERS LN, CAMERON

STOUTE, MARY J, 124
ROGERS LN, CAMERON

STUCKER, MAURICE D,
1196 MERMENTAU RIVER RD,
GRAND CHENIER

STUTES, GENE R, 104
MALLARD LN, GRAND LAKE,

SUIRE, MARIE A, 114
ADAM ROUX ST, CAMERON

SUMMERS, GWEN D, 900
MAIN ST, HACKBERRY

SWIRE, ERNEST, 479 OLD
TOWN RD, HACKBERRY

TAYLOR, CHAD ANTHONY,
137 PINTAIL ST, HOLLY
BEACH

TAYLOR, DEBRA KAY, 150
DONNA RD, GRAND LAKE

TEAL, MARK ALAN, 623
MAIN ST, HACKBERRY

THACKER, CHARLES E,
487 OLD TOWN RD, HACKBER-
RY

THEMIS JR, ROGER
GLENN, 163 MAC ARTHUR ST,
CAMERON

THERIOT, CHAD
MONIQUE, 1724 E CREOLE
HWY, CREOLE

THERIOT, FRANK ANTHO-
NY, 563 MERMENTAU RIVER
RD, GRAND CHENIER

THERIOT, FRANK S, 112
HELEN ST, GRAND CHENIER

THERIOT, SHIRLEY A, 563
MERMENTAU RIVER RD,
GRAND CHENIER

THERIOT, SIDNEY L, 1255
CHENIER PERDUE RD, CRE-
OLE

THIBEAUX, MARCELLE
LYNN, 104 REGAN LN, SWEET-
LAKE

THIBODEAUX, ALICE L,
719 LITTLE CHENIER RD,
CREOLE

THIBODEAUX, ALLEN J,
719 LITTLE CHENIER RD,

LEGAL
NOTICES
Cont. from Page 8.

How to recognize if some is having a stroke

Act F.A.S.T.
FACE

ARMS

SPEECH

TIME

Ask the person to smile.
Does one side of the face droop?

Ask the person to raise both arms.
Does one arm drift downward?

Ask the person to repeat a simple sentence.
Are the words slurred? Can he/she repeat the
sentence correctly?

If the person shows any of these symptoms,
time is important. Call 911 or get to the hospi-
tal fast. Brain cellls are dying.

You grow up the day you
have your first real laugh-at
yourself.

-Ethel Barrymore

The human brain is a most
unusual instrument of ele-
gant and as yet unknown
capacity.     

Stuart Seaton
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Saturday, May 31, 2008

at the Hackberry Recreation Center • 1250 Recreation Circle 

Join neighbors and friends as we officially kick off summer 2008!

• Pool opens at 2 p.m.
• Event begins at 5 p.m. – Hamburgers and hot dogs will be served until 7 p.m.
• Movie under the stars at 8 p.m.
• Games, music and other activities all afternoon.

Enjoy the free food, fun and festivities as we celebrate summer and our community.

Also sponsored by 

Targa Midstream Services & 

Cameron Communications

Powered by 

It was a season of cheers
and tears for the Class B
Softball State Runners-Up,
Grand Lake Lady Hornets;
from an emotionally slow
beginning to an outstanding
finish. The Lady Hornets
dedicated their entire season
to fallen teammate, Lacey
Broussard, and what a sea-
son it was.

They earned the title of
District Champions for the
fourth year in a row, as well
as Regional Champions.
They went through District
and Bi-District playoffs and
the Quarterfinal and
Semifinal rounds with not
one team being able to score
on them. Unfortunately, the
trend ended in the champi-
onship game with the Lady
Hornets losing the state title
3-1.

However, the success of
this team’s members and
coaching staff did not end
here. The Lady Hornets had
14 of their players named to
All-District 1st and 2nd
Teams, four of their players
named to All-State 1st Team

and Honorable Mention, an
All-District MVP, and Coach
of the Year. 

Grand Lake Lady
Hornets head softball coach,
Lindsay Smythe was named
All-District 7-B Coach of the
Year and Class B All-State
Coach of the Year as voted by
the Louisiana Sports Writers
Association.

Senior pitcher, Lakeyn
Duhon was named MVP All-
District 7-B. Earning honors
for All-District 7-B First
Team: Tressa Theriot,
Brittany Hebert, Maggie
Fruge, Sonya Lavergne,
Jasmine Miller, Lakeyn
Duhon, Rebecca Monceaux,
Brandy Carroll, Haley
Pesson, Amber Trahan,
JoeAnna Gaspard, and Halie
Cooper.

Earning honors for All-
District 7-B Second Team:
Jensen Bertrand, Tasha
Fontenot. Earning honors for
Class B All-State First Team:
Lakeyn Duhon, Tressa
Theriot, Class B All-State
Honorable Mention: Brandy
Carroll, Maggie Fruge.

BByy  CCHHRRIISS  &&  LLAAUURRIIEE
MMUUEELLLLEERR

Grand Lake's Lakeyn
Duhon was named the
District 7B Most Valuable
Player. The senior pitcher
had an ERA of 0.00 while
batting .444. Also named to
7B first team were Tressa
Theriot, .778 average;
Brittany Hebert, .750 aver-
age; senior Maggie Fruge,
.636 average; senior Sonya
Lavergne, .600 average; 8th
grader Jasmine Miller, .500
average.

Also 7th grader Rebecca
Monceaux, .444 average;
senior Brandy Carroll, .385
average; senior Haley
Pesson, .308 average; sopho-
more Amber Trahan, .286
average; freshman JoeAnna
Gaspard, .250 average; and
junior Halie Cooper, .200
average. Lady Hornet head
Coach Lindsay Smythe was
named Coach of the Year.
Second team honors went to
Jensen Bertrand and Tasha
Fontenot.

Grand Chenier Library
schedule of events are as fol-
lows:

“Crossword Daze” 10 a.m.
daily 

Thursday, May 29 “After
School Club” Web Surfing &
Research 4 p.m. 

Friday, May 30 “LA Spirit
Hurricane Recovery Team”
Arts & Crafts 1-3 p.m. Story
Time 3 p.m. 

Monday, June 2 Summer
fun at your local library Book
reading: Exploring a new
world

Tueday, June 3-
Wedneday, June 4 “Fitness
Program” Elmocize for chil-
dren 1 p.m., Low impact
walking program 2 p.m. 

Thursday, June 5 Kids
fun day Web Searching and
Research, Nintendo Wii
games

Friday, June 6 Arts &
Crafts 1-3 p.m., Story Time 3
p.m. 

JOE AND ROSALIE Romano were among those
attending the annual reunion of Monk’s Raiders, the 1st
Marine Division, Ammo Company who served together
during the Korean War. The reunion was held at
Armand Richard’s camp on the Mermentau River in
Grand Chenier on May 21.         (Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)

IVY LEBOEUF rode a tricycle in her Mardi Gras cos-
tume as part of the welcome for the 1st Division Ammo
Company, “Monk’s Raiders,” reunion in Grand Chenier
on May 21. (Photo by Cyndi Sellers.)

THE GRAND LAKE Lady Hornets varsity softball team is pictured with a replica of Lacey Broussard (#8) jer-
sey that was signed by the USA Olympic Softball Team at the USA versus the University of Louisiana-Lafayette
softball game held in Sulphur. Lacey’s father and step-mother, Tim and Shona Broussard, presented the jersey
to the team. Though the jersey will soon be moved to a more prominent location, it will temporarily be displayed
on the trophy case at Grand Lake High School, near the high school office. Pictured above are (back row, from
left) head coach Lindsay Smythe, assistant coach, Rachelle Monceaux, Tressa Theriot, Brittany Hebert, Brandy
Carroll, Sonya Lavergne, Maggie Fruge, Amber Trahan; (middle row) Jasmine Miller, Lakeyn Duhon, Haley
Pesson; (front row) Tasha Fontenot, Jensen Bertrand, JoeAnna Gaspard, Rebecca Monceaux, Blair Little, Halie
Cooper, and Karen Miller.

Grand Lake girls honor
their fallen classmate

Grand Lake
gets district

honors

G. Chenier
Library News
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